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Summary Amount (USD)

Professional Services 125,871.50 

Less Hogan Lovells Pro Bono Discount
Less Non-Hogan Lovells Pro Bono Discount 

(43,099.00)
(7,526.48)

Total Professional Services 75,246.02

Disbursements and Charges          9,608.03

Less Discount (based on agreed vs. charged per diem rates) (155.25)

Total Disbursements and Charges 9,452.78

Subtotal 84,698.80

Total Due 84,698.80

Payment Details
Electronic payments should be sent to
Wells Fargo Bank NA, 420 Montgomery Street                      
San Francisco, CA 94104 
Account:  Hogan Lovells  US LLP – Operating Account
SWIFT code:  WFBIUS6S    Account 
No:  2000010688096 
ABA #121000248 For Wire Transfers Only 
ABA #054001220 (For ACH Transfers Only) 

Please send remittance to 
ar@hoganlovells.com

Check payments may be sent to:
Lockbox Services - 75890 
Hogan Lovells US LLP 
P.O. Box 715890 
Philadelphia, PA   19171-5890 

Payment requested within 
30 days from invoice date
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Expenses Overview 
Category Value Discount Charges

Lodging Total 2,406.02 0 2,406.02 

Flights Total  3,773.97 0 3,773.97 

Taxis Total 501.51 0 501.51 

Mileage Total 58.64 0 58.64 

Per Diem Total 1,138.50 155.25 983.25 

Other Professional 1,446.69 0 1,446.69 

Other 282.70 0 282.70 

Total 9,608.03 155.25 9,452.78 

Total Disbursements and Charges USD 9,452.78

Timekeeper Overview

Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Fees

Melissa Bretz
* Provides 15% discount

16.4 60.00 984.00

Courtney Caruso
* Provides 20% pro bono discount in 
addition to discounted blended rate 

8.8 750.00 6,600.00

Christine Cole
* Provides 15% discount 

18.9 230.00 4,347.00

Ronnie Dunn
* Provides 15% discount

29.7 230.00 6,831.00

Randy Dupont
* Provides 15% discount

12.6 230.00 2,898.00

Lisa Fink
* Provides 15% discount

39.0 230.00 8,970.00

Tammy Hooper
* Provides 15% discount

4.0 230.00 920.00

Rick Myers
* Provides 15% discount

33.8 230.00 7,774.00

Meg Olsen
* Provides 15% discount

16.5 75.00 1,237.50

Karl Racine
* Provides 20% pro bono discount in 
addition to discounted blended rate

22.1 750.00 16,575.00

Megan McDonough
* Provides 15% discount

0.8 230.00 184.00

Shunta Boston
* Provides 15% discount

34.0 230.00 7,820.00

Richard Rosenthal
* Provides 15% discount

3.7 230.00 851.00

Victor Ruiz
* Provides 15% discount

8.5 230.00 1,955.00

Charles See  
* Provides 15% discount

23.5 230.00 5,405.00
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Per Diem By Timekeeper 

Timekeeper Dates Days Cleveland,
Ohio

Per Diem

Total Adjusted Total 
Charged

Richard Myers 12/3/23 – 12/6/23 3.5 69.00 241.50 34.50 207.00

Shunta Boston 12/3/23 – 12/7/23 4.5 69.00 310.50 34.50 276.00

Christine Cole 12/11/23 – 12/12/23 1.5 69.00 103.50 34.50 69.00

Randy DuPont 12/11/23 – 12/13/23 2.5 69.00 172.50 51.75 120.75

Stephanie Yonekura 12/11/23 – 12/12/23 1.5 69.00 103.50 0.00 103.50

Karl Racine  12/11/23 – 12/12/23 1.5 69.00 103.50 0.00 103.50

Abby Wilhelm 12/11/23 – 12/12/23 1.5 69.00 103.50 0.00 103.50

Total Per Diem 1,138.50 (155.25)
USD 

983.25

Note: contractors did not calculate partial days correctly; difference of 155.25 that we did not charge 

Disbursement and Charges

AIR TRAVEL - YONEKURA STEPHANIE LAX CLE LAX 12/11/23-12/12/23 838.35
Taxi, 12/12/23, Uber from hotel to courthouse Onsite visit with parties, Stephanie Yonekura 20.51
Stephanie Yonekura - Mileage/Personal Car Home to airport Onsite visit with parties 10.45
Taxi, 12/11/23, Uber from airport to hotel Onsite visit with parties, Stephanie Yonekura 43.00
Taxi, 12/12/23, Uber from courthouse to airport Onsite visit with parties, Stephanie Yonekura 35.26
PARKING - 12/12/23, LAX Parking Onsite visit with parties, Stephanie Yonekura 111.52
Stephanie Yonekura - Tips, 12/12/23, Onsite visit with parties 2.00
Stephanie Yonekura - Mileage/Personal Car with Map, 12/12/23, Airport to home Onsite visit 
with parties

10.43

LODGING - Stephanie Yonekura - 12/12/23, Onsite visit with parties 158.63
WiFi, 12/11/23, In-flight WiFi Onsite visit with parties, Stephanie Yonekura 8.00
LODGING - Abby Jae Wilhelm - 12/12/23, Cleveland Police Monitorship - December 2023 site 
visit

186.83

Timekeeper Overview

Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Fees

Katie O’Brien
* Provides 15% discount

19.6 200.00 3,920.00

Abby Jae Wilhelm
* Provides 100% discount 

46.6 750.00 34,950.00

Stephanie Yonekura
* Provides 20% pro bono discount in 
addition to discounted blended rate

18.2 750.00 13,650.00

Total Professional Services 356.7 USD 125,871.50 
Less Pro Bono Discount (50,625.48)
Total Professional Services Charged USD 75,246.02 
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Disbursement and Charges

WESTGATE COMMUNICATIONS LIMITED - WG-REQ-1124 13th semiannual report and WG-
REQ-1043 2022 use of force Assessment

1,033.35

WESTGATE COMMUNICATIONS LIMITED - WG-REQ-1136 FIT Assessment - Revised 413.34
LODGING - CHRISTINE M. COLE - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department 174.14
CHRISTINE M. COLE - AIRFARE - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department 332.29
TAXI - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 2023, CHRISTINE M. 
COLE -

30.89

TAXI - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 2023, CHRISTINE M. 
COLE -

44.00

PARKING - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 2023, CHRISTINE M. 
COLE

82.00

CHRISTINE M. COLE – Per Diem - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police - December 2023 69.00

Stephanie Yonekura – Per Diem 12/11/23 – 12/12/23 103.50
Karl Racine – Per Diem 12/11/23 – 12/12/23 103.50
Abby Wilhelm – Per Diem 12/11/23 – 12/12/23 103.50
AIR TRAVEL - WILHELM ABBY JAE DCA CLE DCA 12/11/23-12/12/23 512.86
AIR TRAVEL - RACINE KARL ANTHONY DCA CLE DCA 12/11/23-12/12/23 512.86
LODGING - RANDOLPH THOMAS DUPONT - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police 
Department - December 2023

352.50

RANDOLPH THOMAS DUPONT - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Per Diem - 
December 2023

51.75

RANDOLPH THOMAS DUPONT - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Mileage - 
December 2023

6.55

RANDOLPH THOMAS DUPONT - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Per Diem - 
December 2023

69.00

AIR TRAVEL - RANDOLPH THOMAS DUPONT - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police 
Department - December 2023

568.40

RANDOLPH THOMAS DUPONT - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Mileage - 
December 2023

6.55

TAXI - RANDOLPH THOMAS DUPONT - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department -
December 2023

40.00

TAXI - RANDOLPH THOMAS DUPONT - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - 
December 2023

40.00

BOSTON LEGACY GROUP LLC - SHUNTA BOSTON - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police 
Department Per Diem - December 2023

276.00

PARKING - BOSTON LEGACY GROUP LLC - SHUNTA BOSTON - Monitorship for the 
Cleveland Police Department - December 2023

43.48

TAXI - BOSTON LEGACY GROUP LLC - SHUNTA BOSTON - Monitorship for the Cleveland 
Police Department - December 2023

31.56

LODGING - BOSTON LEGACY GROUP LLC - SHUNTA BOSTON - Monitorship for the 
Cleveland Police Department - December 2023

723.82

AIR TRAVEL - BOSTON LEGACY GROUP LLC - SHUNTA BOSTON - Monitorship for the 
Cleveland Police Department - December 2023

362.40

TAXI - BOSTON LEGACY GROUP LLC - SHUNTA BOSTON - Monitorship for the Cleveland 
Police Department - December 2023

37.40

RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Transit - December 2023 5.25
RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Per Diem - December 2023 207.00
TAXI - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 2023 30.91
TAXI - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 2023 25.76
AIR TRAVEL - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 
2023

357.80

TAXI - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 2023 19.70
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Disbursement and Charges

TAXI - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department  - December 2023 18.78
TAXI - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 2023 30.91
AIR TRAVEL - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 
2023

289.01

LODGING - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 
2023

623.27

TAXI - RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department - December 2023 19.76
RWM LIMITED - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Transit - December 2023 5.25
RICHARD ROSENTHAL - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department  - September 2023 
for Richard Rosenthal

24.66

RONNIE A. DUNN - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Parking - December 
2023

16.20

RONNIE A. DUNN - Monitorship for the Cleveland Police Department Parking - December 
2023

9.00

Karl Racine - Taxi, 12/12/23, CLE Monitoring team visit - DCA to home 33.07
Karl Racine - Lodging, 12/12/23, CLE Monitoring team visit - DCA to home 186.83
Total for Other Charges USD 9,452.78

Notes Regarding Expenses 
The City is billed only for the cost of coach airfare. Any upgrades to another class generally happen at the 
discretion of the airline and availability of member status upgrade. Hotel rates--effective June 13, 2023--were 
negotiated by the monitoring team and agreed to by the Parties. The agreed-upon rate is $159, plus tax (unless 
standard rooms are unavailable, in which case rates may be higher).  



Appendix I: Narratives 
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Narratives for Professional Services

Task Codes 
01. Community Engagement & Building Trust
02. Community & Problem-Oriented Policing (CPOP) 
03. Bias-Free Policing
04. Use of Force 
05. Crisis Intervention 
06. Search & Seizure
07. Accountability 
08. Transparency & Oversight
09. Officer Assistance & Support 
10. Supervision 
11. External meetings with one or both parties covering multiple issue-areas
12. Internal monitoring team meetings covering multiple issue-areas 
13. Project Management

Activity Codes
01. Implementation 
02. Assessment 
03. Training
04. Policies 
05. Community Meeting
06. Other 
07. Technical Assistance 

Professional Services

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/01/23 Karl Racine 0.20 150.00 Review draft notice to the Parties regarding 

additional Monitoring Team members
13 06

12/01/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Emails with Monitoring Team 
accountability experts 

07 02

12/01/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.30 225.00 Analyze and assess use of force issues and 
Cleveland Division of Police force report 

04 02

12/01/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.50 375.00 Work on draft notice to the Parties 
regarding additional Monitoring Team 
members

13 06

12/01/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.50 375.00 Discuss how best to accommodate unique 
billing preferences set forth by the City that 
go beyond the course of normal invoicing 
procedures

13 06

12/04/23 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Prepare for internal Monitoring Team 
meeting

12 01

12/04/23 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 Confer with internal Monitoring Team 
regarding multiple areas of the Consent 
Decree

12 01
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/04/23 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Review and draft correspondence related 

to 2022 use of force report
04 01

12/04/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.40 300.00 Analyze Monitoring Team plan regarding 
use of force

04 02

12/04/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Prepare for Monitoring Team biweekly 
meeting 

13 06

12/04/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.90 675.00 Analyze Monitoring Team plan regarding 
accountability 

07 02

12/04/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

1.10 825.00 Participate in Monitoring Team biweekly 
meeting 

11 06

12/04/23 Courtney 
Caruso

1.00 750.00 Participate in Monitoring Team biweekly 
meeting

12 06

12/04/23 Katie O'Brien 3.00 600.00 Create compliance tracker 12 06

12/04/23 Katie O'Brien 1.00 200.00 Confer with L. Fink regarding Monitoring 
Team coordination

12 06

12/04/23 Katie O'Brien 1.00 200.00 Participate in Monitoring Team 
coordination call

12 06

12/04/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.20 150.00 Review agenda submissions from the 
Parties

13 06

12/04/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

1.00 750.00 Confer with internal Monitoring Team 
regarding multiple areas of the Consent 
Decree

12 01

12/04/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.50 375.00 Prepare for internal Monitoring Team 
meeting

12 01

12/04/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.60 450.00 Analyze correspondence related to 2022 
use of force internal affairs report

04 01

12/04/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.90 675.00 Analyze Monitoring Plan edits, feedback, 
and accessibility questions

13 06

12/05/23 Karl Racine 1.20 900.00 Participate in joint meeting with the 
Parties covering multiple issue areas

11 06

12/05/23 Karl Racine 0.30 225.00 Review agenda regarding joint meeting 
with the Parties

11 01

12/05/23 Courtney 
Caruso

1.40 1,050.00 Review and revise Monitoring Plan 12 06

12/05/23 Katie O'Brien 1.20 240.00 Analyze documents and correspondence 
regarding updated policies, GPO, wearable 
and in-car camera, and December site visit 
coordination

13 06

12/05/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.70 525.00 Attention to emails regarding Force Review 
Board and training observations

04 03

12/05/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

1.50 1,125.00 Review Monitoring plan edits 13 06
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/05/23 Abby Jae 

Wilhelm
1.20 900.00 Participate in joint meeting with the 

Parties covering multiple issue areas
11 06

12/05/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

1.00 750.00 Confer with L. Fink and K. O’Brien 
regarding December site visit coordination 
and document review process

13 06

12/05/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.70 525.00 Review invoices to ensure compliance with 
unique requests submitted by the City that 
go beyond the course of normal invoicing 
procedures

13 06

12/05/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.30 225.00 Prepare for internal Monitoring Team 
meeting

06 02

12/05/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.70 525.00 Prepare agenda for joint meeting with the 
Parties, and review correspondence 
regarding same

11 01

12/06/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.20 150.00 Emails regarding DOJ/Monitoring Team 
meeting 

11 06

12/06/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.60 450.00 Use of force preparation for onsite meeting 04 02

12/06/23 Katie O'Brien 1.00 200.00 Confer with L. Fink regarding document 
tracking, meetings, and website 
management

12 06

12/06/23 Katie O'Brien 2.10 420.00 Review 13th semiannual report and update 
compliance rating tracker

13 06

12/06/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.40 300.00 Analyze correspondence related to 
upcoming Community Police Commission 
meetings

01 01

12/06/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.40 300.00 Analyze correspondence related to invoice 
submissions by the Monitoring Team

13 06

12/06/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.20 150.00 Correspond with DOJ regarding site visit 
attendees from the Monitoring Team

13 06

12/06/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.30 225.00 Confer with M. Heyer regarding 
Monitoring Plan accessibility for DOJ

13 01

12/06/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.30 225.00 Confer with billing team regarding 
implementing specifications to comply 
with the City’s unique billing requests that 
go beyond the course of normal invoicing 
procedures

13 06

12/07/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.20 150.00 Analyze issues related to use of force 04 01

12/07/23 Katie O'Brien 0.80 160.00 Participate in meeting with L. Fink and A. 
Wilhelm regarding Consent Decree status 
and strategy

12 06

12/07/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.10 75.00 Confer with B. Maxey regarding upcoming 
assessment needs

13 02
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/07/23 Abby Jae 

Wilhelm 
0.40 300.00 Confer with R. Dunn and C. Cole regarding 

request from City to pause search and 
seizure assessment

06 02

12/07/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.70 525.00 Confer with billing team and legal project 
management team regarding budget

13 06

12/07/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.80 600.00 Confer with L. Fink regarding Consent 
Decree status and strategy

13 06

12/07/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.30 225.00 Attention to email correspondence related 
to billing questions from the billing team

13 06

12/07/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.30 225.00 Further research accessibility-related 
questions and corresponding answers for 
DOJ

13 06

12/07/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.10 75.00 Review and respond to email 
correspondence from M. Griffin regarding 
additional Monitoring Team members

13 06

12/08/23 Karl Racine 0.70 525.00 Confer with Monitoring Team community 
engagement leads regarding community 
developments

01 01

12/08/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

1.10 825.00 Prepare for use of force session at 
Cleveland onsite 

04 02

12/08/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Analyze and assess search and seizure 
issues 

06 02

12/08/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Emails regarding Monitoring Team 
Cleveland site visit

11 06

12/08/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.40 300.00 Respond to billing team regarding various 
billing questions

13 06

12/08/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

1.00 750.00 Confer with C. See and V. Ruiz regarding 
community engagement Monitoring Plan 
entries

01 01

12/08/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.70 525.00 Confer with Monitoring Team community 
engagement leads regarding community 
developments

01 01

12/08/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.50 375.00 Confer with billing team on how best to 
accommodate unique billing preferences 
set forth by the City that go beyond the 
course of normal invoicing procedures

13 06

12/11/23 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 Confer regarding site visit plans 12 06

12/11/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.50 375.00 Prepare for Cleveland onsite visit 13 06

12/11/23 Courtney 
Caruso 

0.50 375.00 Prepare for planning and strategy meeting 
with City and DOJ regarding CIT working 
group and assessment

05 06

12/11/23 Katie O'Brien 0.30 60.00 Confer regarding final agenda for 
December 12 site visit and meeting

13 06
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/11/23 Abby Jae 

Wilhelm
0.40 300.00 Respond to email inquiries related to 

upcoming 12/12 site visit
13 06

12/11/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

3.00 2,250.00 Finalize Monitoring Plan 13 06

12/11/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

1.00 750.00 Conduct outreach to multiple Monitoring 
Team members regarding site visit plans

12 06

12/11/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.30 225.00 Attention to email correspondence related 
to unique requests from the City that go 
beyond the course of normal invoicing 
procedures

13 06

12/11/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.30 225.00 Draft email correspondence related to 14th 
semiannual report

12 06

12/12/23 Karl Racine 7.00 5,250.00 Participate in 12/12 site visit with the 
Parties covering use of force, CIT, and 
search and seizure

11 02

12/12/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

7.00 5,250.00 Prepare for and participate in Cleveland 
onsite meeting 

13 06

12/12/23 Courtney 
Caruso 

1.40 1,050.00 Virtually participate in planning and 
strategy meeting with City and DOJ 
regarding CIT working group and 
assessment and correspond with 
Monitoring Team members regarding 
same

05 02

12/12/23 Courtney 
Caruso 

1.80 1,350.00 Virtually participate in assessment 
planning and strategy meeting with City 
and DOJ

06 02

12/12/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

7.00 5,250.00 Participate in 12/12 site visit with the 
Parties covering use of force, CIT, and 
search and seizure

11 02

12/13/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.70 525.00 Call with Monitoring Team accountability 
team to discuss various issues 

07 02

12/13/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.20 150.00 Analyze composition of Monitoring Team 11 06

12/13/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.60 450.00 Draft email regarding City’s narrative 
feedback

13 06

12/13/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

1.20 900.00 Work on follow-ups from 12/12 site visit 
including Monitoring Plan and action 
items

13 06

12/14/23 Karl Racine 0.60 450.00 Confer regarding City objecting to 
Monitoring Team additions

12 06

12/14/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.20 150.00 Analyze use of force Monitoring Team plan 
items

04 02

12/14/23 Courtney 
Caruso

0.20 150.00 Draft correspondence to City regarding 
agenda for CIT working group

05 05

12/14/23 Katie O'Brien 1.10 220.00 Update list of Monitoring team members 13 06
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/14/23 Katie O'Brien 0.30 60.00 Review and distribute press articles related 

to Consent Decree
13 06

12/14/23 Katie O'Brien 0.50 100.00 Confer with A. Wilhelm and A. Kadden 
regarding Consent Decree budget

13 06

12/14/23 Katie O'Brien 0.80 160.00 Confer with A. Wilhelm and L. Fink 
regarding 14th semiannual report

13 06

12/14/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.60 450.00 Confer regarding City objecting to 
Monitoring Team additions

11 06

12/14/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.20 150.00 Attention to email correspondence related 
to outcome measurements

09 06

12/14/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.50 375.00 Confer with legal project management 
team regarding Consent Decree budget for 
2024

13 06

12/14/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.80 600.00 Confer with L. Fink and K. O’Brien 
regarding the semiannual report process 
and plans

12 02

12/14/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.90 675.00 Draft and send follow up email to the 
Parties after 12/12 site visit

13 06

12/15/23 Karl Racine 0.60 450.00 Confer with Monitoring Team regarding 
City of Cleveland objecting to the 
Monitoring Team adding additional 
members

13 06

12/15/23 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Confer with DOJ regarding site visit follow 
ups

11 06

12/15/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Analyze and assess Monitoring Team 
staffing 

13 06

12/15/23 Katie O'Brien 3.20 640.00 Prepare materials detailing  office of 
professional standards, Community Police 
Review Board, Community Police 
Commission, and Inspector General 2020-
2024 budget and charter references

13 06

12/15/23 Katie O'Brien 1.10 220.00 Coordinate Monitoring Team availability 
for site visits and training

13 06

12/15/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.60 450.00 Confer further regarding City of Cleveland 
objecting to the Monitoring Team adding 
additional members

13 06

12/15/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.50 375.00 Attention to email correspondence related 
to unique preferences of the City that go 
beyond the course of normal invoicing 
procedures

13 06

12/15/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.50 375.00 Attention to 2024 budget predictions 13 06

12/15/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.50 375.00 Confer with DOJ regarding site visit follow 
ups

11 06
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12/18/23 Karl Racine 0.20 150.00 Confer regarding follow-up to the City of 

Cleveland’s objection to Monitoring Team 
member additions

13 06

12/18/23 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Confer with M. Griffin regarding 
Monitoring Team member additions

13 06

12/18/23 Karl Racine 0.60 450.00 Memorialize City’s position on additional 
Monitoring Team members

13 06

12/18/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

1.00 750.00 Participate in Monitoring Team meeting 
regarding assessments 

12 02

12/18/23 Courtney 
Caruso

1.10 825.00 Attend biweekly Monitoring Team meeting 12 06

12/18/23 Katie O'Brien 0.30 60.00 Meet with A. Wilhelm regarding 
Monitoring Team changes and website 
management 

13 06

12/18/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.60 450.00 Correspond with billing team regarding 
invoices and unique requests from the City 
that go beyond the course of normal 
invoicing procedures

13 06

12/18/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.50 375.00 Confer with M. Griffin regarding 
Monitoring Team member additions

13 06

12/18/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.20 150.00 Review Animal Incident correspondence 10 04

12/18/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.10 75.00 Analyze 2024 Monitoring Team site visit 
dates

13 06

12/18/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.30 225.00 Analyze agenda items for 12/19 joint 
Parties meeting

11 06

12/18/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.20 150.00 Seek additional information consistent 
with M. Griffin’s request for biographical 
information for Monitoring Team 
members

13 06

12/18/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.60 450.00 Memorialize City’s position on additional 
Monitoring Team members

13 06

12/18/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.20 150.00 Confer regarding follow-up to the City of 
Cleveland’s objection to Monitoring Team 
member additions

13 06

12/19/23 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 Confer with the Parties regarding multiple 
issue areas of the Consent Decree

11 01

12/19/23 Karl Racine 0.20 150.00 Prepare for meeting with the Parties 12 01

12/19/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.40 300.00 Participate in biweekly call with the Parties 12 06

12/19/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.20 150.00 Follow up with the Parties on action items 13 06

12/19/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

1.00 750.00 Confer with the Parties regarding multiple 
issue areas of the Consent Decree

11 01
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12/19/23 Abby Jae 

Wilhelm
0.20 150.00 Prepare for meeting with the Parties 12 01

12/19/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 

0.20 150.00 Confer with billing team regarding 2024 
plans to comply with City’s unique requests 
that go beyond the course of normal 
invoicing procedures

13 06

12/19/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.60 450.00 Confer with T. Mygatt on follow ups from 
12/12 site visit

13 06

12/20/23 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 Confer regarding 2024 Consent Decree 
budget

13 06

12/20/23 Karl Racine 1.10 825.00 Participate in search and seizure 
assessment call with the City

06 02

12/20/23 Karl Racine 0.30 225.00 Draft email regarding search and seizure 
assessment decision

06 02

12/20/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Emails with parties regarding various 
assessment and Monitoring Team issues 

12 06

12/20/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.50 375.00 Draft email regarding 2024 budget 13 06

12/20/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

1.00 750.00 Confer with Hogan Lovells legal project 
management team regarding 2024 budget

13 06

12/20/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.90 675.00 Participate in search and seizure 
assessment call with the City

06 02

12/20/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.10 75.00 Analyze email correspondence related to 
search and seizure assessment

06 02

12/21/23 Karl Racine 0.30 225.00 Confer internally regarding Brazos issues 
identified by the City

06 04

12/21/23 Karl Racine 1.30 975.00 Participate in search and seizure meeting 
regarding Brazos issues

06 04

12/21/23 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 Discuss Monitoring Team plan, strategy, 
and budget with S. Yonekura and A. 
Wilhelm

12 06

12/21/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

1.00 750.00 Discuss Monitoring Team plan, strategy, 
and budget with S. Yonekura and K. Racine

12 06

12/21/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura 

1.00 750.00 Analyze Monitoring Team plan, status and 
strategy, and budget with K. Racine and A. 
Wilhelm 

12 06

12/21/23 Courtney 
Caruso 

1.40 1,050.00 Participate in CIT Working Group meeting 
and correspond with Monitoring Team 
regarding same

05 05

12/21/23 Katie O'Brien 0.90 180.00 Review pending document tracker for next 
steps

13 06

12/21/23 Katie O'Brien 1.00 200.00 Confer with L. Fink regarding website 
updates

13 06
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12/21/23 Abby Jae 

Wilhelm
0.30 225.00 Confer internally regarding Brazos issues 

identified by the City
06 04

12/21/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

1.30 975.00 Participate in search and seizure meeting 
regarding Brazos issues

06 04

12/22/23 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Participate in second search and seizure 
meeting regarding Brazos issues

06 04

12/22/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.40 300.00 Analyze and assess accountability 07 02

12/22/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Review emails regarding Officer 
Intervention Program status 

10 02

12/22/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.20 150.00 Review emails regarding Outcomes report 08 02

12/22/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Analyze and assess use of force 
assessments 

04 02

12/22/23 Abby Jae 
Wilhelm

0.50 375.00 Participate in second search and seizure 
meeting regarding Brazos issues

06 04

12/26/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Emails regarding 2024 planning 12 06

12/27/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Confer with Parties regarding status of 
outstanding tasks 

11 02

12/27/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Attention to 2024 Monitoring Plan 13 02

12/27/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.30 225.00 Analyze and assess accountability issues 07 02

12/28/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Analyze accountability issues including 
case prep unit manual 

04 02

12/28/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Confer with Parties regarding outstanding 
issues

11 06

12/29/23 Stephanie 
Yonekura

0.10 75.00 Analyze status regarding Monitoring Plan  12 06

12/01/23 Lisa Fink 2.50 575.00 Continue in-depth review of draft 2024 
Monitoring Plan 

13 01

12/01/23 Meg Olsen 0.50 37.50 Review and respond to emails regarding 
invoice review logistics  

13 06

12/01/23 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 Send email and respond to staff regarding 
Zoom discussion 

13 06

12/01/23 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 Send email to the City to follow up on 
outstanding invoices and December billing 
deadline 

13 06
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12/01/23 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 Review and respond to emails from team 

members with individual invoices for 
November  

13 06

12/01/23 Rick Myers 0.40 92.00 Review Disciplinary Letters 09 01

12/01/23 Rick Myers 0.30 69.00 Analyze Consent Decree correspondence 
covering multiple issue areas 

13 01

12/01/23 Rick Myers 0.60 138.00 Review curriculum in preparation for visit 
to audit training 

09 03

12/01/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.50 345.00 Conduct case review in preparation of 
Force Review Board  

04 02

12/01/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.30 299.00 Review Monitoring Plan 2024 search and 
seizure tasks 

13 01

12/03/23 Meg Olsen 1.00 75.00 Compile team invoices for November and 
initial review 

13 06

12/03/23 Rick Myers 1.00 230.00 Prepare for site visit with S. Boston  09 03

12/03/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.20 276.00 Further conduct case review in preparation 
of Force Review Board  

04 02

12/03/23 Ronnie Dunn 2.30 529.00 Review Monitoring Plan 2024 search and 
seizure tasks 

13 01

12/03/23 Shunta 
Boston 

1.00 230.00 Participate in meeting with R. Myers 
regarding in service Session III 
observations 

04 01

12/04/23 Charles See  0.50 115.00 Participate in biweekly Monitoring Team 
meeting 

12 01

12/04/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.50 115.00 Participate in call with T. Mygatt at DOJ 13 01

12/04/23 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 Conduct additional review of draft 2024 
Monitoring Plan 

13 01

12/04/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Participate in Monitoring Team call notes 
and action items 

13 01

12/04/23 Lisa Fink 1.00 230.00 Participate in Monitoring Team 
coordination call with A. Wilhelm and K. 
O'Brien 

13 01

12/04/23 Lisa Fink 1.10 253.00 Participate in Monitoring Team 
coordination call 

12 01

12/04/23 Lisa Fink 0.10 23.00 Send and receive correspondence 
regarding document review statuses 

13 01
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12/04/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Participate in Animal Incident policy and 

inspections unit manual review 
04 04

12/04/23 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 Respond to City and send emails to A. 
Wilhelm regarding December billing 
deadline  

13 06

12/04/23 Meg Olsen 1.00 75.00 Prepare for and participate in Zoom 
discussion with Hogan Lovells billing team 
regarding outstanding invoices and new 
protocol for billing process  

13 06

12/04/23 Meg Olsen 0.30 22.50 Email Hogan Lovells billing team and 
Monitoring Team members for missing 
information 

13 06

12/04/23 Meg Olsen 2.10 157.50 Work on November Invoices and newly 
created contractor timekeeper spreadsheet 
and review spreadsheets for September 
and October 

13 06

12/04/23 Randy 
Dupont 

0.30 69.00 Review of CIT methodology recent issues 05 02

12/04/23 Randy 
Dupont 

1.00 230.00 Participate in Monitoring Team meeting to 
discuss compliance assessment issues 

12 02

12/04/23 Rick Myers 9.50 2,185.00 Prepare for and observe Ordinance Unit, 
Audit Session III in service training class 

09 03

12/04/23 Ronnie Dunn 0.30 69.00 Review minutes from biweekly Monitoring 
Team meeting due to bereavement absence 

12 01

12/04/23 Shunta 
Boston 

9.50 2,185.00 Prepare for and observe Ordinance Unit, 
Audit Session III in service training class 

08 01

12/05/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.20 46.00 Review prior notes and timelines, send 
email to involved parties to keep Officer 
Assistance and Support assessment on 
track 

09 02

12/05/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.80 184.00 Participate in search and seizure planning 
call with A. Wilhelm and R. Dunn and 
follow up with email draft for their review 

06 02

12/05/23 Christine 
Cole 

1.20 276.00 Participate in meeting with 
DOJ/City/Monitoring Team members 

11 01

12/05/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.30 69.00 Follow up with A. Wilhelm on the joint 
Parties meeting 

12 01

12/05/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.30 69.00 Review agenda and necessary materials for 
joint Parties meeting  

13 01
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12/05/23 Christine 

Cole 
0.20 46.00 Review of emails from on site observers, 

recommend next steps due to schedule 
changes 

13 03

12/05/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.30 69.00 Review and respond to emails relative to 
the assessment, the tool, and planning for 
12/12 meeting 

09 02

12/05/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Analyze Officer Intervention Program 
presentation and November meeting notes 

09 01

12/05/23 Lisa Fink 1.00 230.00 Analyze tracking, assigning, and reviewing 
Disciplinary Letters 

07 01

12/05/23 Lisa Fink 1.20 276.00 Participate in Parties’ biweekly call 11 01

12/05/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Prepare for Parties' biweekly call 13 01

12/05/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Analyze notes and action items from 
Parties' biweekly call 

13 01

12/05/23 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 Analyze Corrective Action Policy feedback 07 04

12/05/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Analyze Wearable Camera Policy 
submission 

10 04

12/05/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Participate in training plan review 10 03

12/05/23 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 Send and respond to emails from team 
members regarding November billing  

13 06

12/05/23 Meg Olsen 1.50 112.50 Review and enter additional invoices to 
contractor timekeeper spreadsheet and 
send partial version to Hogan Lovells 
billing team for review  

13 06

12/05/23 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 Respond to and send emails to Hogan 
Lovells team and Monitoring Team 
member regarding billing protocol  

13 06

12/05/23 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 Adjust October invoice and send to Hogan 
Lovells staff for further review  

13 06

12/05/23 Randy 
Dupont 

0.30 69.00 Review of CIT Methodology issues raised 
by Parties and current status of each issue 

05 02

12/05/23 Randy 
Dupont 

1.00 230.00 Participate in meeting with C. Caruso to 
discuss progress on completing 
methodology plan, timetable, and budget 
for assessment process 

05 02

12/05/23 Randy 
Dupont 

0.80 184.00 Review of Parties' feedback on Cleveland 
Division of Police CIT Plan update 

05 01
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12/05/23 Rick Myers 9.50 2,185.00 Prepare for and observe Ordinance Unit, 

Audit Session III in service training class  
09 03

12/05/23 Ronnie Dunn 0.30 69.00 Participate in a discussion with team 
members in preparation for site visit and 
search and seizure meeting 

06 02

12/05/23 Ronnie Dunn 0.80 184.00 Send and review email correspondence to 
the City regarding search and seizure 
assessment pause and preparation for site 
visit meeting 

06 02

12/05/23 Shunta 
Boston 

9.50 2,185.00 Prepare for and observe Ordinance Unit, 
Audit Session III in service training class 

08 01

12/05/23 Shunta 
Boston 

2.00 460.00 Review information related to 5 scheduled 
cases associated with the Force Review 
Board 

08 01

12/06/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.20 46.00 Draft explanatory email and share tool 
with City and DOJ per email request 

06 02

12/06/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.30 69.00 Review and comment on 2024 needs 
assessment and 3 year training plan 

09 03

12/06/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Analyze Disciplinary Letters 07 01

12/06/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Prepare for meeting with K. O’Brien 
regarding multiple issue areas 

13 01

12/06/23 Lisa Fink 1.00 230.00 Participate in call with K. O'Brien to 
discuss document review, meetings, and 
website management 

13 01

12/06/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Conduct follow-ups from call with K. 
O’Brien on multiple case management 
matters 

13 01 

12/06/23 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 Review and respond to emails from Hogan 
Lovells billing team regarding October and 
November invoice and S. Boston regarding 
issues submitting November invoice and 
potential issues on October invoice 

13 06

12/06/23 Meg Olsen 0.80 60.00 Transcribe S. Boston invoice photo into 
master spreadsheet and make corrections 
to October entry and related emails 

13 06

12/06/23 Meg Olsen 1.20 90.00 Review and adjust June and September 
contractor spreadsheets and related emails 
with the Hogan Lovells billing team, and 
send spreadsheets to Hogan Lovells staff  

13 06
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12/06/23 Meg Olsen 1.50 112.50 Finalize and email September and October 

sheets to Hogan Lovells billing team 
members 

13 06

12/06/23 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 Review and respond to emails with R. 
Dupont about his November invoice  

13 06

12/06/23 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 Update November contractor spreadsheet 
and send to Hogan Lovells billing team 

13 06

12/06/23 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 Send and respond to emails from Hogan 
Lovells billing team regarding November 
invoice  

13 06

12/06/23 Rick Myers 6.30 1,449.00 Prepare for and participate in Force 
Review Board 

04 02

12/06/23 Ronnie Dunn 5.10 1,173.00 Monitor Force Review Board meeting 04 02

12/06/23 Shunta 
Boston 

6.00 1,380.00 Prepare for and observe the Force Review 
Board meeting 

08 01

12/06/23 Shunta 
Boston 

2.00 460.00 Complete Force Review Board assessment 
questions  

08 01

12/07/23 Charles See  1.50 345.00 Monitor 1st District Community Policing 
meeting 

01 05

12/07/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.40 92.00 Discuss next steps with A. Wilhelm and R. 
Dunn regarding search and seizure  

06 02

12/07/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.50 115.00 Review and comment on document for S. 
Yonekura for 12/12 agenda prep 

04 02 

12/07/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.10 23.00 Discuss multiple issue areas related to 
Consent Decree compliance strategies, 
with A. Wilhelm 

13 01

12/07/23 Christine 
Cole 

1.10 253.00 Complete review of 2024 needs 
assessment, shared with other Monitoring 
Team members 

09 03

12/07/23 Lisa Fink 0.80 184.00 Participate in meeting with A. Wilhelm and 
K. O'Brien regarding Consent Decree status 
and strategy  

13 01

12/07/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Update document review tracker 13 01

12/07/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Analyze Case Prep manual review 07 04

12/07/23 Lisa Fink 0.80 184.00 Review Camera Systems policies 10 04

12/07/23 Lisa Fink 0.90 207.00 Review inspections unit manual 04 04
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12/07/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Analyze training plan review 06 03

12/07/23 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 Respond to email from staff regarding S. 
Sargent’s invoice and forward original 
invoice to billing team  

13 06

12/07/23 Meg Olsen 0.40 30.00 Respond to emails from Hogan Lovells 
staff about November individual pdfs and 
C. Coles past invoices (Jun - Sept) and 
send copies of those invoices to Hogan 
Lovells  

13 06

12/07/23 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 Send revised November invoice to C. Cole  13 06

12/07/23 Ronnie Dunn 0.30 69.00 Participate in a discussion with team 
members in preparation for site visit and 
search and seizure meeting 

12 01

12/07/23 Shunta 
Boston 

0.40 92.00 Review of the inspections unit booklet 
related to the question raised in the Animal 
policy 

08 04

12/08/23 Charles See  1.70 391.00 Prepare for and participate in community 
engagement team call  

12 01

12/08/23 Victor Ruiz 1.70 391.00 Participate in Monitoring Team meeting 
with the local community engagement 
team 

12 01

12/10/23 Charles See  0.80 184.00 Participate in conversation regarding 
Community Police Commission operations 

01 01

12/10/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.50 345.00 Prepare agenda for site visit search and 
seizure meeting and assessments review 

06 02

12/11/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.30 69.00 Review emails regarding multiple issues, 
including with Divisional Notices, 
Cleveland Division of Police stat rebrand, 
semiannual report scheduling, and final 
agenda for 12/12 meeting 

13 01

12/11/23 Lisa Fink 0.70 161.00 Participate in discussion with A. Wilhelm 
about draft Monitoring Plan 

13 01

12/11/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Review Inspector General filing documents 08 01

12/11/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Analyze Disciplinary Letters 07 01

12/11/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Attention to document management and 
dissemination covering multiple issue 
areas 

13 01

12/11/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Review inspections unit manual comments 04 04
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12/11/23 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 Participate in  discussion with S. Boston 

about inspections unit manual comments 
04 04

12/11/23 Meg Olsen 1.50 112.50 Review and respond to emails with Hogan 
billing team, retrieve individual invoices 
August - October and send to staff for 
Hogan Lovells records  

13 06

12/11/23 Meg Olsen 1.10 82.50 Send emails to Hogan Lovells billing team 
members and review responses, make 
adjustments to October individual sheets, 
and send November individual sheets to 
team 

13 06

12/11/23 Randy 
Dupont 

1.10 253.00 Review of Cleveland Division of Police CIT 
compliance related status in advance of all 
Parties meeting on Consent Decree 
compliance assessment process 

05 02

12/11/23 Rick Myers 0.70 161.00 Debrief K. Racine and A. Wilhelm on site 
visit 

12 03

12/11/23 Ronnie Dunn 2.00 460.00 Prepare for site visit, search and seizure 
meeting, and assessments review 

06 02

12/11/23 Shunta 
Boston 

0.80 184.00 Participate in internal debrief meeting 
regarding the on-site observations of in 
service Session III and the Force Review 
Board meeting  

12 01

12/11/23 Shunta 
Boston 

0.40 92.00 Discuss with L. Fink the inspections unit 
manual and plan moving forward for 
addressing the additional issues in the 
manual not related to the Animal policy 

12 04

12/11/23 Shunta 
Boston 

0.20 46.00 Review updates and add 
comments/questions to inspections unit 
booklet document   

08 04

12/11/23 Tammy 
Hooper 

1.30 299.00 Review and comment on updated 
Wearable Camera System policies 

08 04

12/11/23 Tammy 
Hooper 

1.20 276.00 Review of 2024 Annual needs assessment 
document 

09 03

12/12/23 Charles See  2.00 460.00 Analyze 2nd District Community Policing 
meeting 

01 05

12/12/23 Charles See  7.00 1,610.00 Attend meeting with DOJ, City, Monitoring 
Team, Cleveland Division of Police 
regarding Consent Decree implementation 
issues 

11 01
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12/12/23 Christine 

Cole 
7.00 1,610.00 Participate in 12/12 site visit with the 

Parties covering use of force, CIT, and 
search and seizure 

11 07

12/12/23 Lisa Fink 3.30 759.00 Participate virtually in site visit with 
Parties covering use of force and search 
and seizure 

11 01

12/12/23 Lisa Fink 2.00 460.00 Participate virtually in site visit with 
Parties covering 2024 Monitoring Plan and 
CIT 

11 01

12/12/23 Lisa Fink 0.90 207.00 Analyze notes, action items and key 
takeaways from site visit meetings 

13 01

12/12/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Analyze feedback on inspections unit 
manual 

04 04

12/12/23 Meg Olsen 0.80 60.00 Adjust June - November expense report to 
correct new format requested by Hogan 
Lovells billing team and related emails 

13 06

12/12/23 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 Email to team members about per diem 
protocol and send revised invoices for their 
records 

13 06

12/12/23 Randy 
Dupont 

5.00 1,150.00 Participate in onsite all Parties Meeting 
with Monitoring Team to discuss issues 
that impact on the compliance assessment 
process 

11 02

12/12/23 Ronnie Dunn 6.00 1,380.00 Participate in 12/12 site visit with Parties 
covering use of force, CIT, and search and 
seizure 

11 01

12/12/23 Victor Ruiz 2.80 644.00 Participate in 12/12 site visit with the 
Parties covering use of force, CIT, and 
search and seizure 

11 01

12/13/23 Charles See  2.00 460.00 Analyze full Community Police 
Commission meeting 

01 05

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Participate in call with C. Cole about 
recruitment initiative 

09 01

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Communicate regarding recruitment 
initiative 

09 01

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Analyze Outcome Measures request 08 01

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Prepare for internal accountability meeting 07 01

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.70 161.00 Participate in internal accountability 
meeting 

07 01
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12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Participate in call with R. Myers on 

accountability, Training, and use of force 
13 01

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.70 161.00 Participate in call with A. Wilhelm about 
various topics covering multiple issues of 
the Consent Decree 

13 01

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Analyze Case Prep Unit manual review 07 04

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 Analyze feedback on Corrective Action 
policy and manual 

07 04

12/13/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Analyze feedback on camera systems 
policies 

10 04

12/13/23 Megan 
McDonough 

0.80 184.00 Review and send correspondence 
regarding assessment and identify data 
sources 

05 02

12/13/23 Rick Myers 0.40 92.00 Participate in call with L. Fink regarding 
Disciplinary Letter reviews, patterns, 
concerns 

07 02

12/13/23 Rick Myers 0.70 161.00 Attend accountability Team meeting with 
S. Yonekura and L. Fink 

07 01

12/14/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.50 115.00 Review and respond to emails regarding 
multiple issue areas including Community 
Police Commission meeting, new 
Divisional Notices, and in person meeting 
notes  

13 01

12/14/23 Lisa Fink 0.90 207.00 Participate in internal call regarding 
semiannual report planning 

13 01

12/14/23 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 Analyze project management, task, and 
document tracking 

13 01

12/14/23 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 Analyze feedback on inspections unit 
manual 

04 04

12/14/23 Rick Myers 0.50 115.00 Review final draft of Case Prep manual, 
send comments to Monitoring Team 

07 04

12/14/23 Rick Myers 0.40 92.00 Review and comment on inspections unit 
manual 

07 04

12/15/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Analyze review of updated inspections unit 
manual 

04 04

12/15/23 Shunta 
Boston 

0.10 23.00 Final review and approval of inspections 
unit document related to Animal 
Incidents- sent email regarding same 

08 04
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Date April 5, 2024

Invoice No 22200253754

Our Ref 782711.000002

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/15/23 Shunta 

Boston 
0.50 115.00 Review the Case Prep Unit manual 

(Commander Carney comments 12-11-
2023)  

08 04

12/16/23 Charles See  4.00 920.00 Analyze Scenario Based Police training 01 05

12/16/23 Victor Ruiz 4.00 920.00 Observe Community Police Commission 
scenario based police training 

01 03

12/17/23 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 Review and respond to email from C. Cole 
regarding receipt for December site visit  

13 06

12/18/23 Charles See  0.50 115.00 Participate in engagement team call 12 01

12/18/23 Christine 
Cole 

1.00 230.00 Participate in  Monitoring Team biweekly 
call 

12 01

12/18/23 Lisa Fink 1.00 230.00 Participate in Monitoring Team biweekly 
meeting 

12 01

12/18/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Analyze notes and action items from 
Monitoring Team biweekly call 

13 01

12/18/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Analyze Case Prep manual review 07 04

12/18/23 Lisa Fink 0.10 23.00 Analyze inspections unit manual review 
and response to City 

04 04

12/18/23 Randy 
Dupont 

1.00 230.00 Participate in Monitoring Team meeting to 
discuss compliance assessment issues 

12 02

12/18/23 Rick Myers 1.00 230.00 Participate in biweekly Monitoring Team 
meeting 

12 01

12/18/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.00 230.00 Participate in biweekly Monitoring Team 
Meeting 

12 01

12/18/23 Shunta 
Boston 

1.00 230.00 Participate in biweekly internal Monitoring 
Team meeting 

12 01

12/19/23 Lisa Fink 1.30 299.00 Analyze tracking Disciplinary Letters 07 01

12/19/23 Lisa Fink 0.90 207.00 Participate in Parties' biweekly call 11 01

12/19/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Attention to management and 
dissemination of documents the 
Monitoring Team has worked on 

13 01

12/19/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Analyze notes and action items from 
Parties' biweekly call 

13 01

12/20/23 Christine 
Cole 

1.00 230.00 Participate in  Cleveland Division of Police  
Stat discussion on data use across the 
Division and the rebrand plans 

11 07
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Date April 5, 2024

Invoice No 22200253754

Our Ref 782711.000002

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/20/23 Randy 

Dupont 
1.10 253.00 Participate in discussion of status of 

Cleveland Division of Police CIT Plan 
recent update with Consent Decree Parties 

05 01

12/20/23 Rick Myers 1.00 230.00 Attend monthly Stat meeting with the 
Parties 

11 01

12/20/23 Ronnie Dunn 0.40 92.00 Review Internal Audit Process document 
sent by Dr. Anderson regarding the search 
and seizure assessment and send email 
requesting further detail  

06 02

12/21/23 Christine 
Cole 

1.30 299.00 Participate in discussion with the Parties 
on the search and seizure assessment, Data 
Collection, and IT/form issues 

06 02

12/21/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.50 115.00 Review and comment on Wearable Camera 
System policies 

13 04

12/21/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.50 115.00 Review 3 year training plan 09 03

12/21/23 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 Draft document to track questions 
regarding Disciplinary Letters 

07 01

12/21/23 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 Participate in  Monitoring Team document 
reviews and update tracker 

13 01

12/21/23 Lisa Fink 1.00 230.00 Participate in meeting with K. O'Brien 
regarding website management 

13 01

12/21/23 Randy 
Dupont 

1.00 230.00 Participate in monthly meeting with all 
Parties to discuss compliance assessment 

05 02

12/21/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.30 299.00 Participate in meeting with City to discuss 
IT/data issues and impact on search and 
seizure assessment 

11 02

12/21/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.40 322.00 Review notes from 12/12 site visit search 
and seizure meeting and relevant Consent 
Decree sections in preparation for call with 
Police Accountability Team regarding 
pause of search and seizure assessment 

06 02

12/22/23 Tammy 
Hooper 

1.00 230.00 Review of 3 year training plan 09 03

12/23/23 Ronnie Dunn 0.30 69.00 Participate in meeting with City and DOJ 
to discuss IT/data issues and impact on 
search and seizure assessment 

11 02

12/25/23 Charles See  3.50 805.00 Visit roll call at 1st district and visit station 
staff at 3rd and 4th Districts  

01 01
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Date April 5, 2024

Invoice No 22200253754

Our Ref 782711.000002

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
12/26/23 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Analyze Disciplinary Letters 07 01

12/26/23 Lisa Fink 0.10 23.00 Analyze Divisional Notices 13 01

12/26/23 Lisa Fink 0.80 184.00 Participate in  Monitoring Team review of 
camera systems policies 

10 04

12/26/23 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Participate in  Monitoring Team review of 
training plan and needs assessment 

09 03

12/29/202
3 

Stephanie 
Yonekura 

0.10 75.00 Review emails regarding case prep unit 
manual 

07 02

12/26/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.30 299.00 Review information in preparation of bias-
free Policing and search and seizure 
sections of 14th semiannual report 

06 02

12/27/23 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Respond to internal inquiry for 14th

semiannual report drafting 
13 01

12/27/23 Ronnie Dunn 0.40 92.00 Review and respond to internal Monitoring 
Team correspondence regarding bias-Free 
policing and search and seizure sections of 
14th semiannual report 

03 02

12/28/23 Christine 
Cole 

0.40 92.00 Review of PowerPoint and Monitoring 
Team notes of recent Officer Intervention 
Program meeting to comment on 
Division's efforts toward compliance  

09 02

12/29/23 Rick Myers 1.50 345.00 Review and comment on 3 year training 
plan and 2024 training needs assessment 

09 03 

12/30/23 Shunta 
Boston 

0.60 138.00 Respond to email from R. Dunn who is 
preparing semiannual report related to 
bias-free policing and answer questions 
related observations of in service Session 
III 

03 03

12/30/23 Tammy 
Hooper 

0.50 115.00 Review and respond to Monitoring Team 
email regarding Officer Intervention 
Program plan and presentation 

09 04

12/31/23 Meg Olsen 0.50 37.50 Review and respond to emails from various 
Monitoring Team members with December 
invoices and review invoices 

13 06

12/31/23 Ronnie Dunn 1.00 230.00 Draft section of bias-free policing for 14th 
semiannual report 

03 02

06/02/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email regarding training audit form 13 06
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Invoice No 22200253754

Our Ref 782711.000002

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
06/05/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Emails regarding calendar invitations to 

Hogan Lovells staff 
13 06

06/08/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email regarding deadline 
review chart 

13 06

06/10/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Send Monitoring Team members new 
email address  

13 06

06/14/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Emails regarding pending documents chart 13 06

06/14/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email regarding deadline 
review chart 

13 06

06/21/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email regarding deadline 
review chart 

13 06

06/21/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to A. Wilhelm regarding upcoming 
work 

13 06

06/21/23 Melissa Bretz 1.0 60.00 Attention to document management  13 06

06/23/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email regarding deadline 
review chart 

13 06

06/26/23 Melissa Bretz 0.3 18.00 Emails to C. See and R. Myers regarding 
training audit form 

13 06

06/28/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email regarding deadline 
review chart 

13 06

07/05/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email regarding deadline review chart 13 06

07/06/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email regarding deadline review chart 
update

13 06

07/06/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Monitoring Team members 
regarding internal affairs, office of 
professional standards and case prep 
reports 

13 06

07/14/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Call with Captain Simon regarding new 
contact information 

13 06

07/14/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Captain Simon regarding new 
contact information 

13 06

07/14/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Monitoring Team members 
regarding internal affairs, office of 
professional standards and case prep 
reports 

13 06

07/17/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Emails to Lt. DiPenti regarding biweekly 
case spreadsheets 

13 06
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Date April 5, 2024

Invoice No 22200253754

Our Ref 782711.000002

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
07/17/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Manage documents related to past 

biweekly case spreadsheets  
13 06

07/17/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Monitoring Team members 
regarding internal affairs, office of 
professional standards and case prep 
reports

13 06

07/28/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email regarding scheduling a meeting to 
discuss internal affairs/office of 
professional standards/ case prep reports

13 06

08/01/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Meeting with L. Fink and R. Rosenthal to 
discuss internal affairs, office of 
professional standards and case prep
reports 

13 06

08/01/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Dr. Anderson regarding internal 
affairs status reports distribution list 

13 06

08/01/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 
members regarding deadline review chart 

13 06

08/01/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Email to M. Perez regarding office of 
professional standards biweekly reports 
email distribution list 

13 06

08/01/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Email to Hogan Lovells staff regarding 
Teams app set-up 

13 06

08/01/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Lt. DiPenti regarding email 
distribution list for the Disciplinary, 
Disposition Letters, and Departure Letters 

13 06

08/02/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Hogan Lovells staff regarding 
document review deadline  

13 06

08/02/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Monitoring Team members 
regarding creation of semiannual report 
tracking chart 

13 06

08/04/23 Melissa Bretz 1.0 60.00 Draft and populate the semiannual report 
deadline chart 

13 06

08/04/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Emails to Monitoring Team members 
regarding semiannual report deadline 
chart 

13 06

08/04/23 Melissa Bretz 0.8 48.00 Updates to format of semiannual report 
deadline chart 

13 06

08/04/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to Monitoring Team members 
regarding semiannual report deadline 
chart 

13 06
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Our Ref 782711.000002

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
08/06/23 Melissa Bretz 0.4 24.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 

members regarding semiannual report 
deadline chart 

13 06

08/09/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Emails to Lt. DiPenti regarding contact 
information 

13 06

08/09/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to L. Fink regarding case team 
updates 

13 06

08/09/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 
members regarding semiannual report 
deadline chart 

13 06

08/09/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Emails to Monitoring Team members 
regarding semiannual report deadline 
chart completion items 

13 06

08/10/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 
members regarding deadline chart 

13 06

08/12/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Email to Monitoring Team members 
regarding updates to semiannual report 
deadline chart 

13 06

08/12/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 
members regarding semiannual report 
deadline chart 

13 06

08/12/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Continue update and email to Monitoring 
Team members regarding semiannual 
report deadline chart 

13 06

08/12/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Notify C. See of District Awareness 
Training Refresher deadline 

13 06

08/15/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 
members regarding semiannual report 
deadline chart 

13 06

08/15/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 
members regarding deadline chart

13 06

08/22/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to J. Jones regarding filings  13 06

08/22/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 
members regarding deadline chart

13 06

08/22/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 
members regarding semiannual report 
deadline chart

13 06

08/25/23 Melissa Bretz 0.2 12.00 Emails to Monitoring Team members 
regarding semiannual report deadline 
chart

13 06
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity
08/25/23 Melissa Bretz 0.5 30.00 Update and email to Monitoring Team 

members regarding semiannual report 
deadline chart

13 06

08/31/23 Melissa Bretz 0.1 6.00 Email to L. Fink regarding arbitration 
letters 

13 06

09/06/23 Richard 
Rosenthal 

1.4 322.00 Participate in Monitoring Team call 
regarding accountability documentation, 
follow-up, and correspondence 

12 06

09/27/23 Richard 
Rosenthal 

2.3 529.00 Documentation and transmittal of data and 
information to Monitoring Team 

07 06

Total Professional Services           356.60   125,871.50



Appendix 2: Expenses 



Travel arrangements for YONEKURA/STEPHANIE Agency locator: CUWDHX

Client reference: 782711.000002

ITINERARY VERSION 2 OF 2 - NOV 14, 2023

We have provided your contact information to all carriers on this itinerary. If you wish to remove it, please contact a travel
consultant.

 

View your itinerary in our app: iPhone or Android

 

Effective May 7, 2025, the US Department of Homeland Security (DHS) will enforce the REAL ID Act requiring a REAL ID
compliant driver's license or another acceptable form of identification to fly within the United States. For more information please
visit https://www.dhs.gov/real-id.

Traveling healthier is an important part of the Hogan Lovells firms' culture, please see the attached link that highlights 7 top tips to
ensure that when you travel, you take care of yourself.

http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF

 

 
 

  From / To Flight / Provider Departure /
Arrival  

Other Tue Nov 14, 2023      

Flight
Mon Dec 11, 2023
Los Angeles(LAX) - Cleveland Hopkins
(CLE)

United Airlines UA1527
8:15 AM-
3:43 PM

Check in

Hotel
Mon Dec 11, 2023-
Tue Dec 12, 2023
WESTIN CLEVELAND DOWNTOWN

Westin Hotels And
Resorts

   

Flight
Tue Dec 12, 2023
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE) - Los Angeles
(LAX)

United Airlines UA679
4:21 PM-
6:35 PM

Check in

  Other

Date Tue Nov 14, 2023    

Details UNITED AIRLINES AIRLINE PAID SEAT-LOCATOR-

Links  

Traveler
Benefits

Feedback

Blog

Facebook

LinkedIn



UA
1527

Los Angeles
Los Angeles (LAX)

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Departure Mon Dec 11, 2023 8:15 AM Arrival Mon Dec 11, 2023 3:43 PM

Departure
terminal 7

Arrival
terminal

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

Meal Food to buy Status Confirmed

Duration 04:28
Ticket
number

Seat 14D
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Boeing 737 Air miles 2053

Remarks *PAID 149.00 ECON PLUS AISLE*

Check in   Baggage  

  WESTIN CLEVELAND DOWNTOWN
777 SAINT CLAIR AVENUE NE, CLEVELAND OH 44114, US

Check in Mon Dec 11, 2023 Check out Tue Dec 12, 2023

Status Confirmed Duration 1 night

Room

Rate USD135.00
Approx.
total USD158.63

Telephone
no. 1-216-771-7700 Fax 1-440-201-6363

No. of
rooms 1

No. of
guests 01

Reference 83636914
Freq. guest
ID

Special info.

Remarks CANCEL 1 DAYS PRIOR TO ARRIVAL TO AVOID PENALTY



UA
679

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Los Angeles
Los Angeles (LAX)

Departure Tue Dec 12, 2023 4:21 PM Arrival Tue Dec 12, 2023 6:35 PM

Departure
terminal

Arrival
terminal 7

Class FIRST Airline check
in ID

EKM7ED

Meal Dinner Status Confirmed

Duration 05:14
Ticket
number 0168066189452

Seat 4E
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Boeing 737Max Air miles 2053

Remarks Baggage allowance: 2 pcs

Check in   Baggage  

Invoice/Ticket information for YONEKURA/STEPHANIE

Client reference: 782711.000002

Total Invoiced Amount: $1,027.35

Ticket: 0168066189452 Invoice: 0053460 Amount: $838.35

Payment: Date: 14-Nov-2023    

 

Ticket: 3111417121 Invoice: 0053461 Amount: $149.00

Payment: Date: 14-Nov-2023    

 

Service fee: 2782988651     Amount: $40.00

Description: AIR

Payment: Date: 14-Nov-2023  

 

Information specific to this trip

COVID-19 Updates: Click here to access Travel Vitals™  for the latest information and advisories for
your upcoming itinerary.

Many states and countries have quarantine restrictions, vaccine and documentation requirements.
These requirements may need to be completed several days prior to arrival. Alternatively, ask your
travel consultant to advise of the current requirements. All information related to COVID-19 provided
by Lawyers Travel is based on the information available at the time of reservation and is subject to
change.

For additional information, Please see the DOS website and CDC website. Due to the evolving
nature of COVID-19, we cannot guarantee the accuracy and completeness of any such information
provided.

Lawyers Travel does not represent or warrant that any destination set forth on this itinerary is safe,
advisable to visit or without risk or that any travel restrictions listed are accurate and up to date.
Lawyers Travel assumes no liability for any financial damages or health issues that may result from
travel to such destinations, including, but not limited to, any damages relating to contracting
COVID-19 as a result of reliance on any travel information provided by Lawyers Travel.

Airlines have implemented enhanced security screenings for passengers when departing/arriving at
most airports worldwide. Please ensure you allow extra time to complete the check in process and
to clear security. Many carriers, airports and local municipalities have implemented new regulations
requiring travelers to wear face coverings.

 

Billable/NonBillable: B



Travel Assistance Contact Information

For travel assistance 24 hours a day, please call your dedicated number at 917-408-8216. 

~none~

Your access code is 01TI.

Other information and remarks

Have you obtained a new Driver's License with a Real ID? May 3, 2023, is the deadline for
compliance with this new standard.
Download GO Lawyers Travel, our complimentary mobile application, to view and manage
itineraries, receive flight alerts, check-in online and more. Register with your business email address
so this trip will automatically appear in the My Trips section of the app. iPhone or Android

We value your input and welcome you to provide your feedback  here.

This email was sent from GBT US LSSC,
666 Third Avenue,
Suite 401,
New York, NY 10017

GBT Travel Services UK Limited (GBT UK) and its authorized sublicensees (including Ovation Travel
Group and Egencia) use certain trademarks and service marks of American Express Company or its
subsidiaries (American Express) in the “American Express Global Business Travel” and “American Express
GBT Meetings & Events” brands and in connection with its business for permitted uses only under a limited
license from American Express (Licensed Marks). The Licensed Marks are trademarks or service marks of,
and the property of, American Express. GBT UK is a subsidiary of Global Business Travel Group, Inc.
(NYSE: GBTG). American Express holds a minority interest in GBTG, which operates as a separate
company from American Express.

 

 

 

 

 

 



8:12 AM | 777 Saint Clair Ave NE, Cleveland, OH 44114, US

8:16 AM | 801 W Superior Ave, Cleveland, OH 44113, US

Black     0.77 miles | 3
min

December 12, 2023

Thanks for tipping, Stephanie
We hope you enjoyed your ride this evening.

Total $20.51

Trip fare $16.21

Subtotal $16.21

Tips $3.00

Sales Tax $1.30

Payments

$20.51

Visit the trip page for more information, including invoices (where available)

You rode with John

Issued on behalf of John

Fare does not include fees that may be charged by your bank. Please contact your bank directly for inquiries.



Report ID
Report Name
Expense Owner

Date
Amount Spent
Rate
Distance
Amount Deduction
Distance Deduction
Allocation
Business Purpose
From
To

010063676942
Trip Cleveland 12/11/23 - 12/12/23
Stephanie Yonekura

Dec 11, 2023
10.45 USD
0.6550
15.95 Miles

782711.000002 Cleveland Division of Police Independent Monitorship
Home to airport
Onsite visit with parties

LAX airport (LAX), World Way, Los Angeles, CA, USA

               rx.Observable@1af338d4





3:54 PM | Main Terminal, Cleveland Hopkins International Airport (CLE), Cleveland, OH 44181, US

4:12 PM | 777 Saint Clair Ave NE, Cleveland, OH 44114, US

Comfort     13.04 miles | 18
min

December 11, 2023

Thanks for tipping, Stephanie
We hope you enjoyed your ride this evening.

Total $43.00

Trip fare $26.03

Subtotal $26.03

Booking Fee $3.41

CLE Airport Surcharge $4.00

Tips $7.16

Sales Tax $2.40

Payments

$35.84

$7.16

Visit the trip page for more information, including invoices (where available)

You rode with Valerie

Fare does not include fees that may be charged by your bank. Please contact your bank directly for inquiries.



1:57 PM | 801 W Superior Ave, Cleveland, OH 44113-1888, US

2:15 PM | Main Terminal, Cleveland Hopkins International Airport (CLE), Cleveland, OH 44181, US

Comfort     12.18 miles | 17
min

December 12, 2023

Thanks for tipping, Stephanie
We hope you enjoyed your ride this evening.

Total $35.26

Trip fare $19.73

Subtotal $19.73

Booking Fee $3.76

CLE Airport Surcharge $4.00

Tips $5.87

Sales Tax $1.90

Payments

$29.39

$5.87

Visit the trip page for more information, including invoices (where available)

You rode with Larry

Fare does not include fees that may be charged by your bank. Please contact your bank directly for inquiries.



 



Report ID
Report Name
Expense Owner

Date
Amount Spent
Rate
Distance
Amount Deduction
Distance Deduction
Allocation
Business Purpose
From
To

010063676942
Trip Cleveland 12/11/23 - 12/12/23
Stephanie Yonekura

Dec 12, 2023
10.43 USD
0.6550
15.93 Miles

782711.000002 Cleveland Division of Police Independent Monitorship
Airport to home
Onsite visit with parties

               rx.Observable@17cb75b4





The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

STEPHANIE YONEKURA Page Number  : 1 Invoice Nbr  : 1000126293
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Marriott Bonvoy Number :

11-DEC-23 16:16
12-DEC-23 14:25
1

Tax ID :
The Westin Cle CLEWI  DEC-12-2023  14:30  MHOLL355
Date           Reference    Description        Charges (USD) Credits (USD)
11-DEC-23 RT1706 Rm Chrg - AAA 135.00
11-DEC-23 RT1706 State Tax 10.80
11-DEC-23 RT1706 City Tax 4.05
11-DEC-23 RT1706 County Tax 8.78
12-DEC-23 4006 Restaurant PDR 20.00
12-DEC-23 -178.63

12-DEC-23 8.00
12-DEC-23 -8.00

Continued on the next page



The Westin Cleveland Downtown
777 St. Clair Avenue, NE
Cleveland, OH  44114
United States
Tel: (216) 771-7700

STEPHANIE YONEKURA Page Number  : 2 Invoice Nbr  : 1000126293
Guest Number  :
Folio ID  : A
Arrive Date  :
Depart Date  :
No. Of Guest  :
Room Number  :
Marriott Bonvoy Number :

11-DEC-23 16:16
12-DEC-23 14:25
1

** Total  186.63 -186.63
*** Balance     0.00

I agreed to pay all room & incidental charges. 

Stay well, no matter where you travel. Reconnect with your well-being and find your next destination at westin.com.

Continued on the next page



1

Rodgers, Kristi R.

From:

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2023 1:59 PM

To: Yonekura, Stephanie

Subject: Fwd: Bundles Purchase Confirmation

[EXTERNAL]

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: United Airlines <noreply@united.com> 
Date: December 11, 2023 at 11:44:17 AM EST 
To:  
Subject: Bundles Purchase Confirmation

Add unitedairlines@united.com to your address book.See instructions. 

Thank you for choosing United

Your purchase is complete. 

Flight confirmation number: 

Purchase summary  

LAX to CLE 

Wi-Fi Day Pass $8.00

View trip details 



2

1 traveler 

Stephanie Yonekura $8.00

Receipt number:  

Total $8.00 

Payment method  

Name on card Stephanie Yonekura 

Reservations Deals & offers MileagePlus® My account

This email was sent to syonekura@yahoo.com by United Airlines. 

Please do not reply to this email. We cannot accept electronic replies to this email address. 

© 2019 United Airlines. All rights reserved. United Airlines, Inc.  

233 S. Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606 
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Travel arrangements for WILHELM/ABBY JAE Agency locator: KQJYWL

Client reference: 782711.000002

ITINERARY VERSION 1 OF 1 - DEC 07, 2023

We have provided your contact information to all carriers on this itinerary. If you wish to remove it, please contact a travel
consultant.

 

View your itinerary in our app: iPhone or Android

 

Effective May 7, 2025, the US Department of Homeland Security (DHS) will enforce the REAL ID Act requiring a REAL ID
compliant driver's license or another acceptable form of identification to fly within the United States. For more information please
visit https://www.dhs.gov/real-id.

Traveling healthier is an important part of the Hogan Lovells firms' culture, please see the attached link that highlights 7 top tips to
ensure that when you travel, you take care of yourself.

http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF

 

 
 

  From / To Flight / Provider Departure /
Arrival  

Flight
Mon Dec 11, 2023
Ronald Reagan Washington National Airport(DCA) -
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE)

American Airlines
AA5226

5:52 PM-
7:21 PM

Check in

Flight
Tue Dec 12, 2023
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE) - Ronald Reagan
Washington National Airport(DCA)

American Airlines
AA5553

5:29 PM-
6:55 PM

Check in

AA
5226

Washington D.C.
Ronald Reagan Washington
National Airport (DCA)

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Departure Mon Dec 11, 2023 5:52 PM Arrival Mon Dec 11, 2023 7:21 PM

Departure
terminal 2

Arrival
terminal

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

EZFIMH

Meal Status Confirmed

Duration 01:29
Ticket
number 0018072879511

Seat 11C(Aisle)
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Canadair 700 Air miles 310

Check in   Baggage  

Links  

Traveler
Benefits

Feedback

Blog

Facebook

LinkedIn



AA
5553

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Washington D.C.
Ronald Reagan Washington

National Airport (DCA)

Departure Tue Dec 12, 2023 5:29 PM Arrival Tue Dec 12, 2023 6:55 PM

Departure
terminal

Arrival
terminal 2

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

EZFIMH

Meal Status Confirmed

Duration 01:26
Ticket
number 0018072879511

Seat 11D(Aisle)
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Canadair 700 Air miles 310

Check in   Baggage  

Invoice/Ticket information for WILHELM/ABBY JAE

Client reference: 782711.000002

Total Invoiced Amount: $552.86

Ticket: 0018072879511 Invoice: 0054049 Amount: $512.86

Payment: Date: 07-Dec-2023    

 

Service fee: 2913986192     Amount: $40.00

Description: AIR

Payment: Date: 07-Dec-2023  

 

Information specific to this trip

COVID-19 Updates: Click here to access Travel Vitals™  for the latest information and advisories for
your upcoming itinerary.

Many states and countries have quarantine restrictions, vaccine and documentation requirements.
These requirements may need to be completed several days prior to arrival. Alternatively, ask your
travel consultant to advise of the current requirements. All information related to COVID-19 provided
by Lawyers Travel is based on the information available at the time of reservation and is subject to
change.

For additional information, Please see the DOS website and CDC website. Due to the evolving
nature of COVID-19, we cannot guarantee the accuracy and completeness of any such information
provided.

Lawyers Travel does not represent or warrant that any destination set forth on this itinerary is safe,
advisable to visit or without risk or that any travel restrictions listed are accurate and up to date.
Lawyers Travel assumes no liability for any financial damages or health issues that may result from
travel to such destinations, including, but not limited to, any damages relating to contracting
COVID-19 as a result of reliance on any travel information provided by Lawyers Travel.

Airlines have implemented enhanced security screenings for passengers when departing/arriving at
most airports worldwide. Please ensure you allow extra time to complete the check in process and
to clear security. Many carriers, airports and local municipalities have implemented new regulations
requiring travelers to wear face coverings.

 

Billable/NonBillable: B



Travel Assistance Contact Information

For travel assistance 24 hours a day, please call your dedicated number at 917-408-8216. 

~none~

Your access code is 01TI.

Other information and remarks

Have you obtained a new Driver's License with a Real ID? May 3, 2023, is the deadline for
compliance with this new standard.
Download GO Lawyers Travel, our complimentary mobile application, to view and manage
itineraries, receive flight alerts, check-in online and more. Register with your business email address
so this trip will automatically appear in the My Trips section of the app. iPhone or Android

We value your input and welcome you to provide your feedback  here.

This email was sent from GBT US LSSC,
666 Third Avenue,
Suite 401,
New York, NY 10017

GBT Travel Services UK Limited (GBT UK) and its authorized sublicensees (including Ovation Travel
Group and Egencia) use certain trademarks and service marks of American Express Company or its
subsidiaries (American Express) in the “American Express Global Business Travel” and “American Express
GBT Meetings & Events” brands and in connection with its business for permitted uses only under a limited
license from American Express (Licensed Marks). The Licensed Marks are trademarks or service marks of,
and the property of, American Express. GBT UK is a subsidiary of Global Business Travel Group, Inc.
(NYSE: GBTG). American Express holds a minority interest in GBTG, which operates as a separate
company from American Express.

 

 

 

 

 

 



Travel arrangements for RACINE/KARL ANTHONY Agency locator: MUXHSE

Client reference: 782711.000002

ITINERARY VERSION 1 OF 1 - DEC 07, 2023

We have provided your contact information to all carriers on this itinerary. If you wish to remove it, please contact a travel
consultant.

 

View your itinerary in our app: iPhone or Android

 

Effective May 7, 2025, the US Department of Homeland Security (DHS) will enforce the REAL ID Act requiring a REAL ID
compliant driver's license or another acceptable form of identification to fly within the United States. For more information please
visit https://www.dhs.gov/real-id.

Traveling healthier is an important part of the Hogan Lovells firms' culture, please see the attached link that highlights 7 top tips to
ensure that when you travel, you take care of yourself.

http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF

 

 
 

  From / To Flight / Provider Departure /
Arrival  

Flight
Mon Dec 11, 2023
Ronald Reagan Washington National Airport(DCA) -
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE)

American Airlines
AA5226

5:52 PM-
7:21 PM

Check in

Flight
Tue Dec 12, 2023
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE) - Ronald Reagan
Washington National Airport(DCA)

American Airlines
AA5553

5:29 PM-
6:55 PM

Check in

AA
5226

Washington D.C.
Ronald Reagan Washington
National Airport (DCA)

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Departure Mon Dec 11, 2023 5:52 PM Arrival Mon Dec 11, 2023 7:21 PM

Departure
terminal 2

Arrival
terminal

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

MWHGRV

Meal Status Confirmed

Duration 01:29
Ticket
number 0018072879510

Seat 12C(Aisle)
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Canadair 700 Air miles 310

Check in   Baggage  

Links  

Traveler
Benefits

Feedback

Blog

Facebook

LinkedIn



AA
5553

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Washington D.C.
Ronald Reagan Washington

National Airport (DCA)

Departure Tue Dec 12, 2023 5:29 PM Arrival Tue Dec 12, 2023 6:55 PM

Departure
terminal

Arrival
terminal 2

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

MWHGRV

Meal Status Confirmed

Duration 01:26
Ticket
number 0018072879510

Seat 13D(Aisle)
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Canadair 700 Air miles 310

Check in   Baggage  

Invoice/Ticket information for RACINE/KARL ANTHONY

Client reference: 782711.000002

Total Invoiced Amount: $552.86

Ticket: 0018072879510 Invoice: 0054048 Amount: $512.86

Payment: Date: 07-Dec-2023    

 

Service fee: 6755444475     Amount: $40.00

Description: AIR

Payment: Date: 07-Dec-2023  

 

Information specific to this trip

COVID-19 Updates: Click here to access Travel Vitals™  for the latest information and advisories for
your upcoming itinerary.

Many states and countries have quarantine restrictions, vaccine and documentation requirements.
These requirements may need to be completed several days prior to arrival. Alternatively, ask your
travel consultant to advise of the current requirements. All information related to COVID-19 provided
by Lawyers Travel is based on the information available at the time of reservation and is subject to
change.

For additional information, Please see the DOS website and CDC website. Due to the evolving
nature of COVID-19, we cannot guarantee the accuracy and completeness of any such information
provided.

Lawyers Travel does not represent or warrant that any destination set forth on this itinerary is safe,
advisable to visit or without risk or that any travel restrictions listed are accurate and up to date.
Lawyers Travel assumes no liability for any financial damages or health issues that may result from
travel to such destinations, including, but not limited to, any damages relating to contracting
COVID-19 as a result of reliance on any travel information provided by Lawyers Travel.

Airlines have implemented enhanced security screenings for passengers when departing/arriving at
most airports worldwide. Please ensure you allow extra time to complete the check in process and
to clear security. Many carriers, airports and local municipalities have implemented new regulations
requiring travelers to wear face coverings.

 

Billable/NonBillable: B



Travel Assistance Contact Information

For travel assistance 24 hours a day, please call your dedicated number at 917-408-8216. 

~none~

Your access code is 01TI.

Other information and remarks

Have you obtained a new Driver's License with a Real ID? May 3, 2023, is the deadline for
compliance with this new standard.
Download GO Lawyers Travel, our complimentary mobile application, to view and manage
itineraries, receive flight alerts, check-in online and more. Register with your business email address
so this trip will automatically appear in the My Trips section of the app. iPhone or Android

We value your input and welcome you to provide your feedback  here.

This email was sent from GBT US LSSC,
666 Third Avenue,
Suite 401,
New York, NY 10017

GBT Travel Services UK Limited (GBT UK) and its authorized sublicensees (including Ovation Travel
Group and Egencia) use certain trademarks and service marks of American Express Company or its
subsidiaries (American Express) in the “American Express Global Business Travel” and “American Express
GBT Meetings & Events” brands and in connection with its business for permitted uses only under a limited
license from American Express (Licensed Marks). The Licensed Marks are trademarks or service marks of,
and the property of, American Express. GBT UK is a subsidiary of Global Business Travel Group, Inc.
(NYSE: GBTG). American Express holds a minority interest in GBTG, which operates as a separate
company from American Express.

 

 

 

 

 

 








































































































