
 

 

Hogan Lovells US LLP 
Columbia Square 
555 Thirteenth Street, NW 
Washington, DC 20004-1109 
T  +1 202 637 5600 
F  +1 202 637 5910 
www.hoganlovells.com 

Ohio Northern District Court 
11 W Huron Rd 
Cleveland, OH 44115 
United States 
 

Date December 18, 2023 
Invoice No 22200244444 
Our ref 782711.000002 
Partner Karl Racine 
Email karl.racine@hoganlovells.com 
Fed ID 53-0084704 

  
 
Cleveland Division of Police Independent Monitorship 

 
 
Hogan Lovells US LLP is a limited liability partnership registered in the state of Delaware.  "Hogan Lovells" is an international legal practice that includes Hogan Lovells US LLP and Hogan Lovells 
International LLP, with offices in:  Alicante  Amsterdam  Baltimore  Beijing  Birmingham  Boston  Brussels  Colorado Springs  Denver  Dubai  Dublin   Dusseldorf  Frankfurt  Hamburg  Hanoi  Ho Chi 
Minh City  Hong Kong  Houston  Johannesburg  London  Los Angeles  Luxembourg  Madrid  Mexico City  Miami  Milan  Minneapolis  Monterrey  Munich  New York  Northern Virginia  Paris  Philadelphia  
Rome  San Francisco  São Paulo  Shanghai  Silicon Valley  Singapore  Sydney  Tokyo  Warsaw  Washington, D.C.   Associated Offices:  Budapest  Jakarta  Riyadh  Shanghai FTZ  Ulaanbaatar.   Business 
Service Centers: Johannesburg  Louisville.  Legal Service Center: Berlin. For more information see www.hoganlovells.com 
 

 

 

Summary Amount (USD)
  

Professional Services 124,110.00 
Less Hogan Lovells Pro Bono Discount 
Less Non-Hogan Lovells Pro Bono Discount 

(38,250.00) 
(5,814.00) 

Total Professional Services  80,046.00 
 
Disbursements and Charges          

 
5,496.10 

Less Discount (based on agreed hotel and per diem rates) (461.41) 

Total Disbursements and Charges  5,034.69 
  

 Subtotal 85,080.69 

 Total Due 85,080.69 

  

Payment Details 
Electronic payments should be sent to 
Wells Fargo Bank NA, 420 Montgomery Street                      
San Francisco, CA 94104 
Account:  Hogan Lovells  US LLP – Operating Account 
SWIFT code:  WFBIUS6S    Account 
No:  2000010688096 
ABA #121000248 For Wire Transfers Only 
ABA #054001220 (For ACH Transfers Only) 

 

Please send remittance to 
ar@hoganlovells.com 

Check payments may be sent to: 
Lockbox Services - 75890 
Hogan Lovells US LLP 
P.O. Box 715890 
Philadelphia, PA   19171-5890 

 

Payment requested within 
30 days from invoice date 
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Expenses Overview 

Category Value Discount Charges 

Lodging Total 1,672.47 (0.00) 1,672.47 

Flights Total  2,045.25 (0.00) 2,045.25 

Taxis Total 469.39 (0.00) 469.39 

Meals Total 381.41 (381.41) 0.00 

Per Diem Total 793.50 (0.00) 793.50 

Other 134.08 (80.00) 54.08 
Total 5,496.10 461.41 5,034.69 
Total Disbursements and Charges USD  

 
 
 

Per Diem By Timekeeper 

Timekeeper Dates Days Cleveland, 
Ohio Per Diem 

Total 

Christine Cole 10/25/23 - 10/28/23 1.5 69.00 $103.50 

Karl Racine 10/24/23 - 10/26/23 2.5 69.00 $172.50 

Abby Wilhelm 10/24/23 - 10/26/23 2.5 69.00 $172.50 

Stephanie Yonekura 10/24/23 - 10/26/23 2.5 69.00 $172.50 

Lisa Fink 10/24/23 - 10/26/23 2.5 69.00 $172.50 

Total Per Diem USD $793.50 
 
 
 

Timekeeper Overview 

Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Fees 

Christine Cole 
* Provides 15% discount 

21.70 230.00 4,991.00 

Ronnie Dunn 
* Provides 15% discount 

27.90 230.00 6,417.00 

Randy Dupont 
* Provides 15% discount 

10.60 230.00 2,438.00 

Lisa Fink 
* Provides 15% discount 

43.00 230.00 9,890.00 

Jay Jones 
* Provides 20% pro bono discount in addition 
to discounted blended rate 

8.20 750.00 6,150.00 

Ayesha Hardaway 
* Provides 15% discount 

6.20 230.00 1,426.00 

Tammy Hooper 2.70 230.00 621.00 
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Disbursement and Charges 
 

Travel Agency Fee - RACINE KARL ANTHONY 10/16/23-10/16/23  40.00 

Travel Agency Fee - WILHELM ABBY JAE 10/16/23-10/16/23  40.00 

KARL RACINE - Air Travel - RACINE KARL ANTHONY CLE DCA 10/26/23-10/26/23  256.43 

KARL RACINE - Air Travel - RACINE KARL ANTHONY DCA CLE 10/24/23-10/24/23  284.94 

KARL RACINE - Lodging, 10/26/23, Cleveland Police Monitoring Site Visit 2023  373.66 

KARL RACINE - Hotel - Meals-snacks, 10/24/23, Cleveland Police Monitoring Site Visit 2023  3.00 

CHRISTINE M. COLE - Taxi from CLE to hotel  45.00 

CHRISTINE M. COLE - Uber from BOS to home  52.54 

CHRISTINE M. COLE - Lodging   186.83 

CHRISTINE M. COLE  - Air Travel - Flight for C. Cole  372.60 

Timekeeper Overview 

Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Fees 

* Provides 15% discount 

Rick Myers 
* Provides 15% discount 

8.30 230.00 1,909.00 

Meg Olsen 
* Provides 15% discount 

15.40 75.00 1,155.00 

Karl Racine 
* Provides 20% pro bono discount in addition 
to discounted blended rate 

38.20 750.00 28,650.00 

Megan McDonough 
* Provides 15% discount 

4.10 230.00 943.00 

Shunta Boston 
* Provides 15% discount 

13.00 230.00 2,990.00 

Charles See  
* Provides 15% discount 

14.30 230.00 3,289.00 

Scott Sargent 
* Provides 15% discount 

4.00 230.00 920.00 
 

Victor Ruiz 
* Provides 15% discount 

7.70 230.00 1,771.00 
 

Abby Jae Wilhelm 
* Provides 100% discount 

35.30 750.00 26,475.00 

Stephanie Yonekura 
* Provides 20% pro bono discount in addition 
to discounted blended rate 

32.10 750.00 24,075.00 

Total Professional Services 292.70 USD 124,110.00  

Less Pro Bono Discount (44,064.00) 

Total Professional Services Charged USD 80,046.00 
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Disbursement and Charges 
 

CHRISTINE M. COLE - Uber from hotel to CLE  32.04 

CHRISTINE M. COLE - Uber to PHL airport  40.17 

RONNIE A. DUNN - Parking Ronnie Dunn - October 2023 8.88 

RONNIE A. DUNN - Parking Ronnie Dunn_October 2023  16.20 

LF CONSULTING LLC - Breakfast 10/26/24  12.33 

LF CONSULTING LLC - Breakfast 10/25/23 19.20 

LF CONSULTING LLC - Uber hotel to airport  32.12 

LF CONSULTING LLC - Expenses for L. Fink for October 2023  12.44 

LF CONSULTING LLC - Lunch 10/24 9.94 

LF CONSULTING LLC  - Lodging for L. Fink for October 2023  373.66 

LF CONSULTING LLC - Portion of dinner at Zhug 10.24.23 64.80 

LF CONSULTING LLC - Uber CLE to hotel  50.13 

LF CONSULTING LLC  - Air Travel - Flight for L. Fink  850.39 

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - LODGING - WESTIN CLEVELAND 364.66  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - MEALS - HOTEL DINNER 125.84  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - HOTEL SNACKS 64.80  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - HOTEL SNACKS 12.00  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - UBER FROM AIRPORT TO HOTEL 60.42  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - Breakfast at Starbucks 10.20  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - Tip  2.00  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA -Breakfast at Starbucks 8.86  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - UBER FROM HOTEL TO AIRPORT 38.28  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - IN FLIGHT WIFI 19.00  

STEPHANIE YONEKURA - UBER FROM AIRPORT TO HOME 56.94  

ABBY WILHELM - Air Travel - WILHELM ABBY JAE DCA CLE DCA 10/24/23-10/26/23  280.89 

ABBY WILHELM - BREAKFAST 19.20  

ABBY WILHELM - BREAKFAST 16.80  

ABBY WILHELM -  LODGING - WESTIN CLEVELAND 373.66  

ABBY WILHELM - UBER  8.32  

ABBY WILHELM - UBER FROM HOTEL TO AIRPORT 26.84  

ABBY WILHELM - UBER FROM AIRPORT TO HOME 26.59  

ABBY WILHELM - IN FLIGHT WIFI 10.00  

 
Notes Regarding Expenses 
The City is billed only for the cost of coach airfare. Any upgrades to another class generally happen at the discretion of 
the airline and availability of member status upgrade. Hotel rates--effective June 13, 2023--were negotiated by the 
monitoring team and agreed to by the Parties. The agreed-upon rate is $159, plus tax (unless standard rooms are 
unavailable, in which case rates may be higher).  



Appendix I: Narratives 
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Narratives for Professional Services 

 
Task Codes 

01. Community Engagement & Building Trust 
02. Community & Problem-Oriented Policing (CPOP) 
03. Bias-Free Policing 
04. Use of Force 
05. Crisis Intervention 
06. Search & Seizure 
07. Accountability 
08. Transparency & Oversight 
09. Officer Assistance & Support 
10. Supervision 
11. External meetings with one or both parties covering multiple issue-areas 
12. Internal monitoring team meetings covering multiple issue-areas 
13. Project Management 

 

Activity Codes 
01. Implementation 
02. Assessment 
03. Training 
04. Policies 
05. Community Meeting 
06. Other 
07. Technical Assistance 

 

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity 

10/2/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 Project Management discussion with L. Fink 

13 6 

10/3/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 Analyze and assess use of force issues 

4 2 

10/3/2023 Karl Racine 0.60 450.00 Participate in biweekly call with DOJ 11 6 

10/3/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.60 450.00 

Participate in biweekly DOJ/Monitoring 
Team meeting 

11 2 

10/3/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 Analyze and assess accountability issues 

7 2 

10/3/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.60 450.00 Participate in biweekly call with DOJ 

11 6 

10/4/2023 Karl Racine 0.40 300.00 Participate in biweekly call with the City 11 6 

10/4/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Emails regarding Officer Intervention 
Program issues 

10 2 

10/4/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 Emails regarding accountability 

7 2 

10/5/2023 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Discuss Bolawrap policy changes 12 4 

10/5/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 Discuss Bolawrap policy changes 

12 4 

10/6/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Emails regarding 13th semiannual report 
hearing agenda 

12 2 
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity 
10/6/2023 Karl Racine 2.30 1,725.00 Work on status conference order/agenda 12 1 

10/6/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 2.30 1,725.00 Work on status conference order/agenda 

12 6 

10/9/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 

Monitoring Team meeting regarding search 
and seizure, community engagement, and 
13th semiannual report hearing logistics 

12 2 

10/9/2023 Karl Racine 0.90 675.00 
Participate in biweekly Monitoring Team 
logistics call 

12 1 

10/9/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.90 675.00 

Participate in biweekly Monitoring Team 
logistics call 

12 6 

10/10/2023 Karl Racine 0.70 525.00 
Confer with local Monitoring Team 
members regarding semiannual report 

1 2 

10/10/2023 Karl Racine 0.90 675.00 
Review previous semiannual status 
conferences and Monitor letters 

13 6 

10/10/2023 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Prepare for joint meeting with the parties 13 6 

10/10/2023 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 
Participate in biweekly meeting with the 
parties 

11 6 

10/10/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.70 525.00 

Confer with local Monitoring Team 
monitoring team members regarding 
semiannual report 

1 2 

10/10/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 1.00 750.00 

Participate in biweekly meeting with the 
parties 

11 6 

10/10/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 Prepare for joint meeting with the parties 

13 6 

10/10/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.90 675.00 

Review previous semiannual status 
conferences and Monitor letters 

13 6 

10/11/2023 Karl Racine 1.60 1,200.00 
Review previous semiannual status 
conferences and Monitor letters 

13 6 

10/11/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Email with the Monitoring Team regarding 
outreach to the City concerning outstanding 
items 

11 1 

10/11/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 Analyze and assess accountability issues 

7 2 

10/11/2023 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 

Conduct outreach to the parties and the 
Monitoring Team concerning the Collective 
Bargaining Agreement proposal 

7 4 

10/11/2023 Karl Racine 1.40 1,050.00 
Review Collective Bargaining Agreement 
materials 

7 4 

10/11/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 

Confer regarding staffing and Monitor 
strategy 

13 6 

10/12/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 1.10 825.00 

Call with parties regarding proposed 
discipline change being negotiated with the 
Cleveland Police Patrolmen's Association 
and Fraternal Order of Police 

4 2 

10/12/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 Analyze and assess accountability issues 

4 2 
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity 

10/12/2023 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 
Confer with C. See regarding status 
conference preparation 

1 6 

10/12/2023 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 

Participate in call with the parties regarding 
Collective Bargaining Agreement impact on 
Consent Decree 

13 6 

10/12/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 

Confer with C. See regarding status 
conference prep 

1 6 

10/12/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 1.00 750.00 

Participate in call with the parties regarding 
Collective Bargaining Agreement impact on 
Consent Decree 

13 6 

10/13/2023 Karl Racine 3.20 2,400.00 Write Monitor letter for semiannual report 13 2 
10/16/2023 Karl Racine 3.40 2,550.00 Review semiannual report prior to filing 13 2 

10/16/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 5.80 4,350.00 Review semiannual report for filing 

13 2 

10/16/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 1.60 1,200.00 

Prepare notice to the parties and 
community regarding the semiannual report 
filing 

13 2 

10/17/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 

Review Force Investigation Team 
assessment status 

4 2 

10/17/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.30 225.00 

Analyze and assess status and strategy for 
hearing and engagement of the parties 

12 2 

10/17/2023 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Participate in biweekly meeting with DOJ 11 6 

10/17/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 1.00 750.00 

Participate in biweekly Monitoring 
Team/DOJ meeting 

11 2 

10/17/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 Participate in biweekly meeting with DOJ 

11 6 

10/18/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.90 675.00 

Review and edit Force Investigation Team 
assessment for filing based on submissions 
from and discussions with the parties 

4 2 

10/18/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 

Analyze and review semi-annual report in 
preparation for hearing 

13 2 

10/18/2023 Jay Jones 0.20 150.00 

Conference with K. Racine regarding 
changes to Collective Bargaining Agreement 
made between Cleveland Police 
Department and police unions 

12 6 

10/18/2023 Jay Jones 0.30 225.00 

Review DOJ submission regarding position 
on Collective Bargaining Agreement 
provisions necessitating Monitoring Team 
and Court involvement 

12 6 

10/18/2023 Jay Jones 0.50 375.00 

Review City of Cleveland submission 
regarding position on Collective Bargaining 
Agreement provisions being outside scope 
of Consent Decree 

12 6 

10/18/2023 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 
Participate in biweekly meeting with the 
City 

12 6 

10/18/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 1.10 825.00 

Participate in biweekly City/Monitoring 
Team call 

12 2 
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity 

10/18/2023 Karl Racine 0.30 225.00 
Participate in project management call with 
L. Fink 

11 6 

10/18/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 1.10 825.00 

Analyze and assess Collective Bargaining 
Agreement amendment issue and parties 
positions 

7 2 

10/18/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.30 225.00 

Participate in project management call with 
L. Fink 

11 6 

10/18/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 

Participate in biweekly meeting with the 
City 

12 6 

10/19/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.40 300.00 

Edit and finalize Force Investigation Team 
assessment 

4 2 

10/19/2023 Jay Jones 0.30 225.00 

Review DOJ submission regarding position 
on collective bargaining provisions 
necessitating Monitoring Team and Court 
involvement 

12 6 

10/19/2023 Jay Jones 0.40 300.00 

Review City of Cleveland submission 
regarding position on Collective Bargaining 
Agreement provisions being outside scope 
of Consent Decree 

12 6 

10/19/2023 Jay Jones 1.40 1,050.00 

Draft memorandum regarding Collective 
Bargaining Agreement and whether Consent 
Decree is implicated 

12 6 

10/20/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.20 150.00 

Analyze and assess upcoming meetings with 
parties and status conference logistics 

12 6 

10/20/2023 Jay Jones 1.00 750.00 

Draft memorandum regarding Collective 
Bargaining Agreement and whether Consent 
Decree is implicated 

12 6 

10/20/2023 Jay Jones 1.00 750.00 

Research relevant case law regarding 
Collective Bargaining Agreement 
superseding court order or settlement 
agreement 

12 6 

10/22/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.50 375.00 

Review Use of Force semiannual reports in 
preparation for 13th semiannual report 
hearing 

4 2 

10/22/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 Summarize Use of Force priority chronology 

4 2 

10/22/2023 Karl Racine 1.50 1,125.00 Preparation for status conference 13 2 

10/22/2023 Jay Jones 0.80 600.00 

Draft memorandum regarding Collective 
Bargaining Agreement and whether Consent 
Decree is implicated 

12 6 

10/22/2023 Jay Jones 0.20 150.00 

Correspond with K. Racine, A. Wilhelm, and 
S. Yonekura regarding Collective Bargaining 
Agreement legal memorandum 

12 6 

10/23/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 Analyze Use of Force reporting 

4 2 

10/23/2023 Karl Racine 0.20 150.00 
Confer with A. Hardaway regarding 
Monitoring Team role 

12 6 
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity 

10/23/2023 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 
Participate in preparatory call with the 
Court 

12 2 

10/23/2023 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 
Participate in biweekly logistics call with the 
Monitoring Team 

12 1 

10/23/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 1.00 750.00 

Participate in preparatory call with the 
Court 

12 2 

10/23/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.20 150.00 

Confer with A. Hardaway regarding 
Monitoring Team role 

12 6 

10/23/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 1.00 750.00 

Participate in biweekly logistics call with the 
Monitoring Team 

12 6 

10/23/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.20 150.00 

Call with L. Fink regarding project 
management 

13 6 

10/24/2023 Jay Jones 1.00 750.00 
Draft notice regarding the Force 
Investigation Team assessment 

13 6 

10/24/2023 Jay Jones 0.20 150.00 

Correspond with K. Racine regarding notice 
of Monitoring Team Force Investigation 
Team assessment 

13 6 

10/24/2023 Jay Jones 0.20 150.00 
File notice of Monitoring Team Force 
Investigation Team assessment 

13 6 

10/24/2023 Jay Jones 0.20 150.00 
Correspond with A. Wilhelm regarding court 
filing 

13 6 

10/24/2023 Jay Jones 0.20 150.00 
Correspond with parties regarding filing of 
Force Investigation Team assessment report 

13 6 

10/24/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 5.00 3,750.00 

Prepare for status hearing by review of 
semiannual report, prior semiannual report, 
and transcript from prior hearing 

12 2 

10/24/2023 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 
Confer with the parties regarding action 
items and general progress 

11 1 

10/24/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 1.00 750.00 

Confer with the parties regarding action 
items and general progress 

11 1 

10/24/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 

Confer with Hogan Lovells legal project 
management team regarding project 
management 

13 6 

10/25/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 4.00 3,000.00 

Prepare for status conference hearing with 
Monitoring Team 

12 2 

10/25/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 1.00 750.00 Debrief regarding status conference 

12 2 

10/25/2023 Karl Racine 4.00 3,000.00 Prepare for status conference hearing 12 2 

10/25/2023 Karl Racine 4.00 3,000.00 
Prepare for status conference hearing with 
Monitoring Team members 

12 2 

10/25/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 8.10 6,075.00 

Prepare for, participate in, and debrief 
regarding status hearing 

11 2 

10/25/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 2.30 1,725.00 Participate in status conference hearing 

11 2 

10/25/2023 Karl Racine 2.30 1,725.00 Participate in status conference hearing 11 2 
10/25/2023 Karl Racine 1.00 750.00 Debrief regarding status conference 11 2 
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity 

10/25/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Email with Monitoring Team regarding 
discipline 

7 2 

10/25/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 1.00 750.00 Debrief regarding status conference 

11 2 

10/25/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 2.30 1,725.00 Participate in status conference hearing 

11 2 

10/25/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 4.00 3,000.00 Prepare for status conference hearing 

12 2 

10/25/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 4.00 3,000.00 

Prepare for status conference hearing with 
Monitoring Team members 

12 2 

10/27/2023 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 
Call with R. Dupont regarding crisis 
intervention methodology 

5 2 

10/27/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 

Call with R. Dupont regarding crisis 
intervention methodology 

5 2 

10/27/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 

Confer with Hogan Lovells legal project 
management team regarding project 
management 

13 6 

10/29/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Emails regarding Officer Intervention 
Program issues 

10 2 

10/29/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.50 375.00 

Analyze accountability status and party 
engagement 

7 2 

10/30/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.30 225.00 

Emails regarding accountability issues 
including working group and discussions 
with the parties 

4 2 

10/30/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Email regarding Monitoring Team staffing at 
various meetings 

11 6 

10/30/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Emails regarding Officer Intervention 
Program status 

10 2 

10/31/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.50 375.00 

Analyze and assess status and strategy for 
Use of Force assessment 

4 2 

10/31/2023 Jay Jones 0.30 225.00 
Prepare use of force documents and Session 
III training notice for filing 

12 6 

10/31/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.50 375.00 

Participate in biweekly DOJ/Monitoring 
Team call 

11 6 

10/31/2023 Karl Racine 0.50 375.00 Participate in biweekly status call with DOJ 11 6 

10/31/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Continuation of work on emails regarding 
Officer Intervention Program status 

10 2 

10/31/2023 
Stephanie 
Yonekura 0.10 75.00 

Email with Monitoring Team regarding 
Session III training 

2 3 

10/31/2023 
Abby Jae 
Wilhelm 0.50 375.00 Participate in biweekly status call with DOJ 

11 6 

10/1/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.50 115.00 

Email correspondence with Monitoring 
Team and end of the month administrative 
task 

13 6 

10/1/2023 Meg Olsen 0.30 22.50 
Review and respond to emails with team 
regarding invoices for October 

13 6 
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10/2/2023 Lisa Fink 2.00 460.00 
Conducted final read-through of 13th 
semiannual report 

13 2 

10/2/2023 Lisa Fink 0.80 184.00 
Attention to charge and discipline letters 
and Internal Affairs update 

7 1 

10/2/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 

Conduct communications about Internal 
Affairs Manual review and scheduling 
meeting with parties 

7 6 

10/2/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Attention to emails about call attendance 
and task management 

13 6 

10/2/2023 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 
Participate in call with A. Wilhelm about 
project management strategies 

13 6 

10/2/2023 Meg Olsen 0.50 37.50 

Participate in Zoom with A. Wilhelm 
regarding outstanding invoices and other 
administrative tasks 

13 6 

10/2/2023 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 
Respond to emails with team member 
about October billing cycle 

13 6 

10/2/2023 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 Participate in Training biweekly call 11 3 
10/2/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Attention to Training call follow-ups 13 3 

10/3/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 1.20 276.00 

Complete test case 2022-003443345 for 
Search and Seizure assessment. 

7 2 

10/3/2023 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 
Attention to September disciplinary letter 
reviews by Monitoring Team members 

7 2 

10/3/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.80 184.00 

Review of parties' response to proposed 
assessment methodology 

5 2 

10/3/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 

Review and forward Internal Affairs 
materials for Monitoring Team 
consideration 

7 6 

10/3/2023 Charles See  0.50 115.00 
Conversation with community member re: 
upcoming status conference 

1 6 

10/3/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.50 115.00 

Participate in DOJ and Monitoring Team 
meeting 

11 6 

10/3/2023 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 Participate in biweekly call with DOJ 11 6 

10/3/2023 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 
Attention to notes and follow-up 
communications from call with DOJ 

13 6 

10/3/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.10 23.00 

Email communication between Monitoring 
Team and City/CDP regarding redacted test 
case files 

6 6 

10/3/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.50 115.00 

Review and confirm language for 
semiannual report, engage via email with L. 
Fink and S. Yonekura on same 

4 6 

10/3/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Attention to notes from October 2, 2023 
training call 

13 3 

10/4/2023 Lisa Fink 0.90 207.00 
Attention to search and seizure training 
materials for compliance consideration 

6 2 

10/4/2023 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 
Sampling and distributing discipline letters 
for Monitoring Team review 

7 6 
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10/4/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.30 69.00 Join call with Monitoring Team and the City 

11 6 

10/4/2023 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 
Participate in City/Monitoring Team 
biweekly call 

11 6 

10/4/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Attention to notes and follow-ups from call 
with the City 

13 6 

10/4/2023 Meg Olsen 2.50 187.50 

Work on July invoice and emails to team 
members regarding needed information, 
email to A. Wilhelm regarding the July 
invoice 

13 6 

10/4/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.20 46.00 

Email correspondence between Monitoring 
Team regarding review of Search and 
Seizure status in semiannual report 

6 6 

10/5/2023 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 
Respond to emails from C. Cole and R. 
Dupont about July billing issues 

13 6 

10/5/2023 
Tammy 
Hooper 1.00 230.00 

Provide analysis of draft policy on pilot 
program use of Bolawrap device 

4 4 

10/5/2023 Scott Sargent 1.00 230.00 Participate in Bolawrap Zoom call/discussion 4 4 
10/5/2023 Scott Sargent 2.00 460.00 Review Bolawrap policy/status 4 4 

10/6/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.30 69.00 

Review of Cleveland Police Department 
accomplishments 

5 2 

10/6/2023 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 
Review and respond to emails with team 
regarding invoices 

13 6 

10/6/2023 Meg Olsen 1.00 75.00 
Work on July invoice and sent to A. Wilhelm 
for review 

13 6 

10/6/2023 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 
Communications and research about 
Bolawrap discussions 

4 4 

10/7/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.30 69.00 
Internal email correspondence regarding 
Search and Seizure test case review 

6 2 

10/7/2023 Meg Olsen 2.40 180.00 Work on August invoice 13 6 

10/7/2023 Scott Sargent 1.00 230.00 
Review and respond to emails with internal 
team 

4 4 

10/9/2023 
Megan 
McDonough 0.30 69.00 Review DOJ comments on methodology 

5 2 

10/9/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 1.00 230.00 

Complete test case 2022-03443345 in 
Evidence.com  

6 2 

10/9/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.40 92.00 

Discussion with K. Racine and R. Dunn on 
search and seizure paragraphs  and 
assessment for semiannual report and plans 
for assessment 

6 2 

10/9/2023 Ronnie Dunn 2.00 460.00 
Draft status update and Search and Seizure 
assessment timeline overview email for DOJ 

6 2 

10/9/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.50 115.00 
Participate in internal Monitoring Team 
assessment meeting 

6 2 

10/9/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 0.80 184.00 

Participate in Monitoring Team biweekly 
logistics call 

12 1 
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10/9/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.80 184.00 

Participate in Monitoring Team logistics 
meeting 

12 1 

10/9/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.80 184.00 Participate in biweekly logistics meeting 12 1 

10/9/2023 Charles See  1.00 230.00 
Monitoring Team logistics call re: Consent 
Decree implementation 

12 1 

10/9/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Attention to charge and disposition letter 
tracking 

7 6 

10/9/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.50 115.00 

Review and comment on report with DOJ 
edits included 

2 6 

10/9/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Forward Divisional Notices for Monitoring 
Team awareness 

13 6 

10/9/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Update Monitoring Team website for 
community 

13 6 

10/9/2023 Meg Olsen 1.50 112.50 
Work on August invoice and emails to A. 
Wilhelm regarding various invoices 

13 6 

10/9/2023 Meg Olsen 0.50 37.50 Finalize and submit July invoice to parties 13 6 

10/10/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.20 46.00 

Discussion with M. McDonough on the 
assessment and planning 

5 2 

10/10/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 1.00 230.00 

Meet with DOJ/City including Crisis Review 
intervention training assessment 
methodology 

5 2 

10/10/2023 
Megan 
McDonough 0.20 46.00 

Prepare for call with parties to discuss 
assessment 

5 2 

10/10/2023 
Megan 
McDonough 0.30 69.00 

Participate in joint call with parties to 
discuss assessment 

5 2 

10/10/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.50 115.00 

Review notes, reports, and communications 
to prepare talking points for upcoming 
status conference 

13 2 

10/10/2023 Charles See  1.50 345.00 
Participate in 2nd District Community 
Policing meeting 

1 5 

10/10/2023 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 
Attention to Monitoring Team's review of 
2023 CPOP Report 

2 1 

10/10/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.70 161.00 
Participate in Monitoring Team Community 
Engagement Meeting 

1 1 

10/10/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.80 184.00 

Participate in meeting with the parties to 
discuss status conference agenda and 
updates 

11 1 

10/10/2023 Victor Ruiz 0.50 115.00 

Participate in Monitoring Team Meeting 
with the local engagement team to discuss 
the semiannual report 

12 1 

10/10/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.70 161.00 

Join and participate in the call with all 
parties 

11 6 

10/10/2023 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 

Attention to Monitoring Team logistics call 
notes and status conference preparation 
emails 

13 6 

10/10/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Update Monitoring Team website 13 6 
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10/10/2023 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 

Review and respond to emails from A. 
Wilhelm and billing team about invoicing 
schedule 

13 6 

10/10/2023 Lisa Fink 3.00 690.00 
Review Session III Training in full and edited 
court notice for filing these materials 

4 3 

10/11/2023 Rick Myers 1.00 230.00 

Read, comment and return draft of 
Community & Problem-Oriented Policing 
report to community 

2 2 

10/11/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 1.00 230.00 

Re-review test case 2022-03443345 for 
Search and Seizure assessment to include 
video and complete assessment tool 

6 2 

10/11/2023 
Ayesha 
Hardaway 0.50 115.00 

Review and analyze draft Collective 
Bargaining Agreement changes and 
correspondence from M. Griffin 

7 1 

10/11/2023 
Ayesha 
Hardaway 0.40 92.00 

Discussion with K. Racine and A. Wilhelm re: 
draft Collective Bargaining Agreement 
changes 

7 1 

10/11/2023 
Christine 
Cole 1.00 230.00 

Discussion with DOJ/City/Monitoring Team 
on Collective Bargaining Agreement and 
Discipline Matrix 

11 6 

10/11/2023 Rick Myers 0.20 46.00 
Join phone call with A. Wilhelm and K. 
Racine re: City's negotiations over discipline 

12 6 

10/11/2023 Rick Myers 0.80 184.00 

Review Consent Decree language and 
implications from proposed Collective 
Bargaining Agreement changes re: discipline 

9 6 

10/11/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.30 69.00 

Review of emails related to Collective 
Bargaining Agreement sent by the City 

13 6 

10/11/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.60 138.00 

Assemble materials and drafting for the 
status hearing 

13 6 

10/11/2023 Lisa Fink 0.70 161.00 
Attention to document tracking and follow-
ups with the City 

13 6 

10/11/2023 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 
Prepare for website update for semiannual 
report 

13 6 

10/11/2023 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 
Reply to emails from R. Rosenthal regarding 
September billing 

13 6 

10/11/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.60 138.00 

Email correspondence to schedule 
CDP/Monitoring Team Search and Seizure 
meeting and other Monitoring Team items 

6 7 

10/12/2023 
Ayesha 
Hardaway 1.40 322.00 

Prepare for and participate in virtual 
meeting with parties and external legal 
counsel for City of Cleveland re: Collective 
Bargaining Agreement negotiations and 
their impact on the Consent Decree 

7 1 

10/12/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Attention to accountability related 
correspondence and documents 

7 6 

10/12/2023 Rick Myers 0.70 161.00 
Participate in biweekly Office of Professional 
Standards briefing 

7 6 
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10/12/2023 Charles See  1.00 230.00 Prepare for status conversation 1 6 

10/12/2023 Rick Myers 1.50 345.00 

Participate in special meeting with 
Monitoring Team, DOJ, City, CDP to discuss 
Collective Bargaining Agreement changes on 
discipline that impact the Consent Decree 

11 6 

10/12/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Review notes and action items from this 
week's calls and follow-up emails 

13 6 

10/13/2023 
Ayesha 
Hardaway 0.40 92.00 

Phone call with K. Racine re: semiannual 
report and upcoming status conference 

12 1 

10/13/2023 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 
Review and respond emails from S. Boston 
regarding her W9 

13 6 

10/14/2023 Ronnie Dunn 1.00 230.00 

Review documents in preparation of talking 
points on Stop, Search, and Seizure for the 
status conference 

6 6 

10/14/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.70 161.00 

Review documents in preparation of talking 
points on Stop, Search, and Seizure for the 
status conference 

6 6 

10/15/2023 Meg Olsen 1.50 112.50 
Work on September invoice and related 
emails to various team members 

13 6 

10/15/2023 Ronnie Dunn 5.50 1,265.00 
Draft Stop, Search, and Seizure comments 
for the Status Conference 

6 6 

10/16/2023 Charles See  0.50 115.00 
Phone conference re: Community Policing 
Commission members' roles 

1 6 

10/16/2023 
Christine 
Cole 1.00 230.00 

Finalize and share written document for 
status hearing, comment and share stop 
document 

13 6 

10/16/2023 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 
Send email to M. Heyer at DOJ regarding 
April/May invoice approval 

13 6 

10/16/2023 Meg Olsen 1.70 127.50 
Work on September invoice and emails to C. 
See and A. Wilhelm regarding the invoice 

13 6 

10/17/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.40 92.00 

Conversation with S. Yonekura to prepare 
for the status hearing 

4 2 

10/17/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.60 138.00 

Participate in DOJ and Monitoring Team 
meeting 

11 6 

10/17/2023 
Tammy 
Hooper 0.40 92.00 Review information for CDPStat meeting 

11 6 

10/17/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 Attention to CDPStat materials 13 6 

10/17/2023 Lisa Fink 0.40 92.00 
Attention to talking points for status 
conference 

13 6 

10/17/2023 Meg Olsen 0.50 37.50 
Finalize September invoice and send to A. 
Wilhelm for review 

13 6 

10/18/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 0.80 184.00 

Participate in CDP CompStat Meeting: 
Topics included Use of Force and Internal 
Affairs Division 

7 2 

10/18/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.20 46.00 

Internal Monitoring Team email 
correspondence in preparation for status 
conference 

6 2 
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10/18/2023 
Christine 
Cole 1.10 253.00 

Prepare draft talking points for S. Yonekura 
for status hearing 

4 2 

10/18/2023 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 
Attention to Monitoring Team's feedback on 
2023 CPOP Report 

2 1 

10/18/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.20 46.00 

Respond to internal emails on next steps 
and scheduling next call with City 

9 1 

10/18/2023 Lisa Fink 0.10 23.00 Upload charge letters and divisional notices 7 6 

10/18/2023 Rick Myers 0.80 184.00 
Participate in monthly CDP CompStat 
meeting, focus on Internal Affairs 

7 6 

10/18/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.80 184.00 

Development of Crisis Intervention Team 
Report to the Federal Court 

5 6 

10/18/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.20 46.00 

Participate in bi-weekly call with City Law 
and Monitoring Team 

11 6 

10/18/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Participate in City/Monitoring Team 
biweekly call 

11 6 

10/18/2023 
Tammy 
Hooper 0.80 184.00 Participate in CDPStat meeting 

11 6 

10/18/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Attention to semiannual report and website 
management 

13 6 

10/18/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Attention to notes and follow-ups from call 
with the City 

13 6 

10/18/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Participate in project management call with 
K. Racine and A. Wilhelm 

13 6 

10/18/2023 Lisa Fink 1.40 322.00 
Prepare materials for Monitor reference for 
status conference 

13 6 

10/18/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Review final semiannual report 13 6 

10/18/2023 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 
Send emails to M. Heyer and A. Wilhelm 
regarding various invoices pending approval 

13 6 

10/18/2023 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 

Review and respond to emails from the City 
and send email to A. Wilhelm regarding the 
matter 

13 6 

10/18/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.30 69.00 

Email correspondence to schedule 
CDP/Monitoring Team Search and Seizure 
meeting 

6 7 

10/19/2023 
Ayesha 
Hardaway 1.40 322.00 

Review and revise Force Intervention 
Training assessment 

7 2 

10/19/2023 Charles See  1.00 230.00 

Confer with 2nd District Officer regarding 
community engagement and Consent 
Decree matters 

1 5 

10/19/2023 
Ayesha 
Hardaway 0.80 184.00 

Review and analyze briefing from the 
parties re: draft Collective Bargaining 
Agreement changes 

7 1 

10/19/2023 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 
Continue work on preparing materials for 
Monitor reference for status conference 

13 6 

10/19/2023 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 
Review emails from City regarding July 
invoice and sent emails to A. Wilhelm 

13 6 
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10/19/2023 Meg Olsen 0.30 22.50 
Respond to email from A. Wilhelm, finalize 
August bill and submit to parties 

13 6 

10/19/2023 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 

Review of past emails and send email to A. 
Wilhelm regarding status of outstanding 
invoices 

13 6 

10/19/2023 Meg Olsen 0.30 22.50 

Review and respond to emails with City 
regarding June, July and August invoices and 
subsequent emails to A. Wilhelm 

13 6 

10/20/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 1.20 276.00 

Review of parties' response to proposed 
assessment methodology 

5 2 

10/20/2023 
Ayesha 
Hardaway 0.40 92.00 Discussion with Judge Oliver 

12 1 

10/20/2023 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 
Review letters regarding Collective 
Bargaining Agreement and discipline issue 

7 6 

10/20/2023 Lisa Fink 0.70 161.00 
Draft reference documents for Monitor for 
status conference 

13 6 

10/20/2023 Meg Olsen 0.20 15.00 

Submit April/May invoice to Court for 
processing and send related emails to A. 
Wilhelm and Court finance apartment 

13 6 

10/21/2023 Lisa Fink 3.30 759.00 
Continue drafting reference documents for 
Monitor for status conference 

13 6 

10/21/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 Upload charge letters and divisional notices 13 6 

10/22/2023 Ronnie Dunn 3.50 805.00 
Review and summary of Search and Seizure 
test cases 

6 2 

10/22/2023 Rick Myers 1.50 345.00 
Prepare materials for K. Racine to present at 
this week's status conference 

2 5 

10/23/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 3.00 690.00 

Review September samples of Disposition 
Letters and input information into tracking 
document 

7 2 

10/23/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.60 138.00 

Discussion on Community and Problem 
Oriented Policing report with L.Fink 

2 2 

10/23/2023 Lisa Fink 1.50 345.00 

Attention to phone calls with Monitoring 
Team members and correspondence 
regarding Team's feedback on City's 
Community and Problem Oriented Policing 
Report 

2 1 

10/23/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 0.70 161.00 

Participate in Monitoring Team biweekly 
logistics call 

12 1 

10/23/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.80 184.00 

Participate in Monitoring Team logistics 
meeting, draft and send follow up emails for 
training and status hearing preparation 

12 1 

10/23/2023 Lisa Fink 0.70 161.00 Participate in Monitoring Team logistics call 12 1 

10/23/2023 
Ayesha 
Hardaway 0.90 207.00 Discussions re: upcoming status conference 

12 1 

10/23/2023 Rick Myers 0.70 161.00 

Participate in Monitoring Team's biweekly 
logistics meeting preparation for status 
conference 

12 1 
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10/23/2023 Charles See  0.50 115.00 
Participate in Monitoring Team logistics call 
re: upcoming schedule for Cleveland visit 

12 1 

10/23/2023 Lisa Fink 1.40 322.00 Attention to discipline letter tracking 7 6 

10/23/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Attention to emails regarding status 
conference preparations 

13 6 

10/23/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Attention to notes and follow-up from 
logistics call 

13 6 

10/23/2023 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 
Finalize reference documents for Monitor 
for status conference 

13 6 

10/23/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Call with A. Wilhelm regarding Monitoring 
Plan and project management 

13 6 

10/23/2023 Rick Myers 0.80 184.00 
Monitor meeting of the Training Advisory 
Committee 

9 3 

10/24/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 0.50 115.00 

Review and send correspondence 
concerning October Disposition Letters 

7 2 

10/24/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 1.00 230.00 

Review September samples of Disposition 
Letters 

7 2 

10/24/2023 Ronnie Dunn 0.20 46.00 
Internal email correspondence regarding 
Search and Seizure test case review 

6 2 

10/24/2023 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 Review disciplinary letters 7 1 

10/25/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.50 115.00 Prepare for status hearing reviewing notes 

13 2 

10/25/2023 Ronnie Dunn 3.00 690.00 Individual preparation for status conference 11 5 

10/25/2023 Ronnie Dunn 3.00 690.00 
Prepare with Monitoring Team for status 
conference 

11 5 

10/25/2023 Ronnie Dunn 4.00 920.00 Participate in status conference 11 5 

10/25/2023 
Christine 
Cole 4.00 920.00 

Prepare for status conference with 
Monitoring Team 

12 1 

10/25/2023 
Christine 
Cole 1.00 230.00 Debrief on status conference hearing 

12 1 

10/25/2023 Charles See  2.30 529.00 Participate in status conference hearing 1 6 
10/25/2023 Charles See  1.00 230.00 Debrief regarding status conference 1 6 

10/25/2023 
Christine 
Cole 2.30 529.00 Participate in status conference hearing. 

11 6 

10/25/2023 Lisa Fink 2.30 529.00 Participate in status conference 11 6 
10/25/2023 Victor Ruiz 2.20 506.00 Participate in status conference 11 6 

10/25/2023 Lisa Fink 4.00 920.00 
Prepare for status conference with 
Monitoring Team members 

12 6 

10/25/2023 Lisa Fink 1.00 230.00 Debrief about status conference 12 6 

10/25/2023 Victor Ruiz 4.00 920.00 
Prepare for status conference hearing with 
Monitoring Team 

12 6 

10/25/2023 Victor Ruiz 1.00 230.00 Debrief regarding status conference 12 6 

10/25/2023 Charles See  4.50 1,035.00 
Prepare for status conference hearing with 
Monitoring Team 

12 6 

10/25/2023 Meg Olsen 0.10 7.50 
Review and respond to emails from Court 
Clerk 

13 6 
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Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity 

10/26/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.80 184.00 

Discussion of assessment methodology with 
the parties 

5 2 

10/26/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 1.20 276.00 

Work with Monitoring Team member M. 
McDonough on assessment methodology 

5 2 

10/26/2023 
Megan 
McDonough 0.30 69.00 Review CDP comments on methodology 

5 2 

10/26/2023 
Megan 
McDonough 1.20 276.00 

Call with Dr. Dupont to discuss revisions to 
methodology 

5 2 

10/26/2023 Rick Myers 0.30 69.00 
Participate in biweekly Office of Professional 
Standards briefing 

7 6 

10/26/2023 Charles See  0.50 115.00 
Phone conferences re: Community Policing 
Commission and status conversation 

1 6 

10/26/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 1.00 230.00 

Participate in Crisis Intervention Training 
workgroup monthly meeting 

5 6 

10/26/2023 Lisa Fink 1.10 253.00 Review status conference notes 13 6 

10/26/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.50 115.00 

Review of Crisis Intervention 40-hour 
training 

5 3 

10/27/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 0.50 115.00 

Review information with L. Fink related to 
Disposition Letters 

7 2 

10/27/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.70 161.00 

Discussion with Monitor, K. Racine, and 
Monitoring Team member A. Wilhelm on 
assessment methodology feedback and 
revisions 

5 2 

10/27/2023 
Megan 
McDonough 0.30 69.00 

Discuss court hearing/methodology with C. 
Cole 

5 2 

10/27/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.30 69.00 

Discussion with M. McDonough on various 
topics including:  assessment planning and 
status hearing debrief 

12 2 

10/27/2023 Lisa Fink 0.80 184.00 
Attention to discipline letter tracking and 
review 

7 1 

10/27/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Call with S. Boston about disciplinary letters 
and upcoming accountability meetings 

7 1 

10/27/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Attention to accountability meeting 
preparation 

7 6 

10/27/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.20 46.00 

Review emails to schedule Officer 
Intervention Program meeting with the 
parties 

13 6 

10/27/2023 Lisa Fink 0.10 23.00 
Provide status conference notes to 
Monitoring Team 

13 6 

10/27/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Attention to correspondence and project 
management tasks 

13 6 

10/28/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 0.50 115.00 

Review the remainder of the September 
Disposition letters 

7 2 

10/28/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.30 69.00 

Review of Attorney General memorandum 
on Consent Decree processes 

5 2 
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 Date December 18, 2023 
 Invoice No 22200244444 
 Our Ref 782711.000002 
   
 

  
 

 

Date Name Hours Amount Description Task Activity 

10/30/2023 
Tammy 
Hooper 0.50 115.00 

Review responses to Stop and Search test 
case assessment and competed follow-up 
email 

6 2 

10/30/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Attention to scheduling meeting for 
accountability section 

7 6 

10/30/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.10 23.00 

Review emails and personnel schedules in 
order to schedule the next meeting 

9 6 

10/31/2023 
Shunta 
Boston 2.00 460.00 

Review comments provided by DOJ in the 
Internal Affairs Manual 

7 2 

10/31/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.30 69.00 

Discussion with Monitor, K. Racine, and 
Monitoring Team member A. Wilhelm on 
assessment methodology feedback and 
revisions 

5 2 

10/31/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.90 207.00 

Work with Monitoring Team member M. 
McDonough on assessment methodology 

5 2 

10/31/2023 
Megan 
McDonough 1.50 345.00 

Call with Dr. Dupont to discuss revisions to 
methodology 

5 2 

10/31/2023 
Christine 
Cole 1.00 230.00 

Review tool completed by T. Hooper, reply 
to internal team with suggested next steps 

6 2 

10/31/2023 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 Attention to disciplinary letters 7 1 

10/31/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.60 138.00 

Participate in DOJ and Monitoring Team 
meeting 

12 1 

10/31/2023 Lisa Fink 0.60 138.00 Participate in biweekly meeting with DOJ 11 6 

10/31/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.30 69.00 

Respond to Consent Decree related emails, 
work on scheduling Use of Force assessment 
discussion with internal team 

13 6 

10/31/2023 Lisa Fink 0.50 115.00 
Conduct several project management 
follow-ups 

13 6 

10/31/2023 Lisa Fink 0.20 46.00 
Attention to notes and action items from 
meeting with DOJ 

13 6 

10/31/2023 Lisa Fink 0.30 69.00 
Attention to various project management 
related emails 

13 6 

10/31/2023 Meg Olsen 0.60 45.00 

Review and respond to emails from various 
team members about October billing and 
initial review of October invoices 

13 6 

10/31/2023 
Christine 
Cole 0.20 46.00 

Schedule Officer Intervention Program 
meeting with the parties 

9 7 

10/31/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.60 138.00 

Discussion on community participation in 
recent CDP training with Monitoring Team 
member C. See 

5 3 

10/31/2023 
Randy 
Dupont 0.20 46.00 

Discussion on community participation in 
recent CDP training with Mental Health 
Response Advisory Committee members 

5 3 

 



Appendix 2: Expenses 



Travel arrangements for RACINE/KARL ANTHONY Agency locator: IOYATQ

Client reference: 782711.000000

ITINERARY VERSION 1 OF 1 - OCT 18, 2023

We have provided your contact information to all carriers on this itinerary. If you wish to remove it, please contact a travel
consultant.

 

View your itinerary in our app: iPhone or Android

 

Effective May 7, 2025, the US Department of Homeland Security (DHS) will enforce the REAL ID Act requiring a REAL ID
compliant driver's license or another acceptable form of identification to fly within the United States. For more information please
visit https://www.dhs.gov/real-id.

Traveling healthier is an important part of the Hogan Lovells firms' culture, please see the attached link that highlights 7 top tips to
ensure that when you travel, you take care of yourself.

http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF

 

 
 

  From / To Flight / Provider Departure /
Arrival  

Flight
Tue Oct 24, 2023
Ronald Reagan Washington National Airport(DCA) -
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE)

American Airlines
AA5522

5:59 PM-
7:28 PM

Check in

AA
5522

Washington D.C.
Ronald Reagan Washington
National Airport (DCA)

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Departure Tue Oct 24, 2023 5:59 PM Arrival Tue Oct 24, 2023 7:28 PM

Departure
terminal 2

Arrival
terminal

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

ATWNFF

Meal Status Confirmed

Duration 01:29
Ticket
number 0018062958035

Seat 13C(Aisle)
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Canadair 700 Air miles 310

Check in   Baggage  

Links  

Traveler
Benefits

Feedback

Blog

Facebook

LinkedIn

http://www.lawyerstravel.com/
https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/go-lawyers-travel/id1140506669?mt=8
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.manticpoint.android.golawyers&hl=en
https://www.dhs.gov/real-id
http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.tripadvisor.com/AirlineFees
https://www.tripadvisor.com/AirlineFees
http://www.lawyerstravel.com/travelbenefits
http://www.lawyerstravel.com/travelbenefits
http://lawyerssurvey.lawyerstravel.com/survey
http://lawyerstravel.com/blog/
https://www.facebook.com/LawyersTravel
http://www.linkedin.com/company/lawyers-travel
http://preferredhotels.lawyerstravel.com/


Invoice/Ticket information for RACINE/KARL ANTHONY

Client reference: 782711.000000

Total Invoiced Amount: $324.94

Ticket: 0018062958035 Invoice: 0052671 Amount: $284.94

Payment: Date: 18-Oct-2023    

 

Service fee: 5796249134     Amount: $40.00

Description: AIR

Payment: Date: 18-Oct-2023  

 

Information specific to this trip

COVID-19 Updates: Click here to access Travel Vitals™  for the latest information and advisories for
your upcoming itinerary.

Many states and countries have quarantine restrictions, vaccine and documentation requirements.
These requirements may need to be completed several days prior to arrival. Alternatively, ask your
travel consultant to advise of the current requirements. All information related to COVID-19 provided
by Lawyers Travel is based on the information available at the time of reservation and is subject to
change.

For additional information, Please see the DOS website and CDC website. Due to the evolving
nature of COVID-19, we cannot guarantee the accuracy and completeness of any such information
provided.

Lawyers Travel does not represent or warrant that any destination set forth on this itinerary is safe,
advisable to visit or without risk or that any travel restrictions listed are accurate and up to date.
Lawyers Travel assumes no liability for any financial damages or health issues that may result from
travel to such destinations, including, but not limited to, any damages relating to contracting
COVID-19 as a result of reliance on any travel information provided by Lawyers Travel.

Airlines have implemented enhanced security screenings for passengers when departing/arriving at
most airports worldwide. Please ensure you allow extra time to complete the check in process and
to clear security. Many carriers, airports and local municipalities have implemented new regulations
requiring travelers to wear face coverings.

 

Billable/NonBillable: B

Travel Assistance Contact Information

For travel assistance 24 hours a day, please call your dedicated number at 917-408-8216. 

~none~

Your access code is 01TI.

Other information and remarks

Have you obtained a new Driver's License with a Real ID? May 3, 2023, is the deadline for
compliance with this new standard.
Download GO Lawyers Travel, our complimentary mobile application, to view and manage
itineraries, receive flight alerts, check-in online and more. Register with your business email address
so this trip will automatically appear in the My Trips section of the app. iPhone or Android

Feedback

We value your input and welcome you to provide your feedback  here.

 

https://travelvitals.amexgbt.com/
https://travelvitals.amexgbt.com/
https://travel.state.gov/content/travel/en/traveladvisories/traveladvisories.html/
https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/travelers/index.html
https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/go-lawyers-travel/id1140506669?mt=8
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.manticpoint.android.golawyers&hl=en
http://lawyerssurvey.lawyerstravel.com/survey


Travel arrangements for RACINE/KARL ANTHONY Agency locator: JJVBZB

Client reference: 782711.000002

ITINERARY VERSION 1 OF 1 - OCT 16, 2023

We have provided your contact information to all carriers on this itinerary. If you wish to remove it, please contact a travel
consultant.

 

View your itinerary in our app: iPhone or Android

 

Effective May 7, 2025, the US Department of Homeland Security (DHS) will enforce the REAL ID Act requiring a REAL ID
compliant driver's license or another acceptable form of identification to fly within the United States. For more information please
visit https://www.dhs.gov/real-id.

Traveling healthier is an important part of the Hogan Lovells firms' culture, please see the attached link that highlights 7 top tips to
ensure that when you travel, you take care of yourself.

http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF

 

 
 

  From / To Flight / Provider Departure /
Arrival  

Flight
Thu Oct 26, 2023
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE) - Ronald Reagan
Washington National Airport(DCA)

American Airlines
AA5615

2:30 PM-
3:54 PM

Check in

AA
5615

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Washington D.C.
Ronald Reagan Washington

National Airport (DCA)

Departure Thu Oct 26, 2023 2:30 PM Arrival Thu Oct 26, 2023 3:54 PM

Departure
terminal

Arrival
terminal 2

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

EPXRMM

Meal Status Confirmed

Duration 01:24
Ticket
number 0018059889483

Seat 12C(Aisle)
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Canadair 700 Air miles 310

Check in   Baggage  

Links  

Traveler
Benefits

Feedback

Blog

Facebook

LinkedIn

http://www.lawyerstravel.com/
https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/go-lawyers-travel/id1140506669?mt=8
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.manticpoint.android.golawyers&hl=en
https://www.dhs.gov/real-id
http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.tripadvisor.com/AirlineFees
https://www.tripadvisor.com/AirlineFees
http://www.lawyerstravel.com/travelbenefits
http://www.lawyerstravel.com/travelbenefits
http://lawyerssurvey.lawyerstravel.com/survey
http://lawyerstravel.com/blog/
https://www.facebook.com/LawyersTravel
http://www.linkedin.com/company/lawyers-travel
http://preferredhotels.lawyerstravel.com/


Invoice/Ticket information for RACINE/KARL ANTHONY

Client reference: 782711.000002

Total Invoiced Amount: $296.43

Ticket: 0018059889483 Invoice: 0052580 Amount: $256.43

Payment: Date: 16-Oct-2023    

 

Service fee: 6989891554     Amount: $40.00

Description: AIR

Payment: Date: 16-Oct-2023  

 

Information specific to this trip

COVID-19 Updates: Click here to access Travel Vitals™  for the latest information and advisories for
your upcoming itinerary.

Many states and countries have quarantine restrictions, vaccine and documentation requirements.
These requirements may need to be completed several days prior to arrival. Alternatively, ask your
travel consultant to advise of the current requirements. All information related to COVID-19 provided
by Lawyers Travel is based on the information available at the time of reservation and is subject to
change.

For additional information, Please see the DOS website and CDC website. Due to the evolving
nature of COVID-19, we cannot guarantee the accuracy and completeness of any such information
provided.

Lawyers Travel does not represent or warrant that any destination set forth on this itinerary is safe,
advisable to visit or without risk or that any travel restrictions listed are accurate and up to date.
Lawyers Travel assumes no liability for any financial damages or health issues that may result from
travel to such destinations, including, but not limited to, any damages relating to contracting
COVID-19 as a result of reliance on any travel information provided by Lawyers Travel.

Airlines have implemented enhanced security screenings for passengers when departing/arriving at
most airports worldwide. Please ensure you allow extra time to complete the check in process and
to clear security. Many carriers, airports and local municipalities have implemented new regulations
requiring travelers to wear face coverings.

 

Billable/NonBillable: B

Travel Assistance Contact Information

For travel assistance 24 hours a day, please call your dedicated number at 917-408-8216. 

~none~

Your access code is 01TI.

Other information and remarks

Have you obtained a new Driver's License with a Real ID? May 3, 2023, is the deadline for
compliance with this new standard.
Download GO Lawyers Travel, our complimentary mobile application, to view and manage
itineraries, receive flight alerts, check-in online and more. Register with your business email address
so this trip will automatically appear in the My Trips section of the app. iPhone or Android

Feedback

We value your input and welcome you to provide your feedback  here.

 

https://travelvitals.amexgbt.com/
https://travelvitals.amexgbt.com/
https://travel.state.gov/content/travel/en/traveladvisories/traveladvisories.html/
https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/travelers/index.html
https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/go-lawyers-travel/id1140506669?mt=8
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.manticpoint.android.golawyers&hl=en
http://lawyerssurvey.lawyerstravel.com/survey
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Travel arrangements for WILHELM/ABBY JAE Agency locator: EPVDXM

Client reference: 782711.000002

ITINERARY VERSION 1 OF 1 - OCT 16, 2023

We have provided your contact information to all carriers on this itinerary. If you wish to remove it, please contact a travel
consultant.

 

View your itinerary in our app: iPhone or Android

 

Effective May 7, 2025, the US Department of Homeland Security (DHS) will enforce the REAL ID Act requiring a REAL ID
compliant driver's license or another acceptable form of identification to fly within the United States. For more information please
visit https://www.dhs.gov/real-id.

Traveling healthier is an important part of the Hogan Lovells firms' culture, please see the attached link that highlights 7 top tips to
ensure that when you travel, you take care of yourself.

http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF

 

 
 

  From / To Flight / Provider Departure /
Arrival  

Flight
Tue Oct 24, 2023
Ronald Reagan Washington National Airport(DCA) -
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE)

American Airlines
AA5522

5:59 PM-
7:28 PM

Check in

Flight
Thu Oct 26, 2023
Cleveland Hopkins(CLE) - Ronald Reagan
Washington National Airport(DCA)

American Airlines
AA5615

2:30 PM-
3:54 PM

Check in

AA
5522

Washington D.C.
Ronald Reagan Washington
National Airport (DCA)

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Departure Tue Oct 24, 2023 5:59 PM Arrival Tue Oct 24, 2023 7:28 PM

Departure
terminal 2

Arrival
terminal

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

EPVPQB

Meal Status Confirmed

Duration 01:29
Ticket
number 0018059889482

Seat 11C(Aisle)
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Canadair 700 Air miles 310

Check in   Baggage  

Links  

Traveler
Benefits

Feedback

Blog

Facebook

LinkedIn

http://www.lawyerstravel.com/
https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/go-lawyers-travel/id1140506669?mt=8
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.manticpoint.android.golawyers&hl=en
https://www.dhs.gov/real-id
http://hlglobal/sites/Services/Travel/Guides/TravelHealthAndWellness.PDF
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.tripadvisor.com/AirlineFees
https://www.tripadvisor.com/AirlineFees
http://www.lawyerstravel.com/travelbenefits
http://www.lawyerstravel.com/travelbenefits
http://lawyerssurvey.lawyerstravel.com/survey
http://lawyerstravel.com/blog/
https://www.facebook.com/LawyersTravel
http://www.linkedin.com/company/lawyers-travel
http://preferredhotels.lawyerstravel.com/


AA
5615

Cleveland
Cleveland Hopkins (CLE)

Washington D.C.
Ronald Reagan Washington

National Airport (DCA)

Departure Thu Oct 26, 2023 2:30 PM Arrival Thu Oct 26, 2023 3:54 PM

Departure
terminal

Arrival
terminal 2

Class ECONOMY Airline check
in ID

EPVPQB

Meal Status Confirmed

Duration 01:24
Ticket
number 0018059889482

Seat 12D(Aisle)
Frequent
flyer

Equipment Canadair 700 Air miles 310

Check in   Baggage  

Invoice/Ticket information for WILHELM/ABBY JAE

Client reference: 782711.000002

Total Invoiced Amount: $320.89

Ticket: 0018059889482 Invoice: 0052579 Amount: $671.54

Exch ticket: 0017968940418     Amount: -$390.65

Penalty:         $0.00

Total charge:         $280.89

Payment: 6 Date: 16-Oct-2023    

 

Service fee: 4683985561     Amount: $40.00

Description: TICKET EXCH

Payment: Date: 16-Oct-2023  

 

Information specific to this trip

You have purchased a non-refundable fare on American Airlines. Any changes are subject to
change fee plus any fare increase
COVID-19 Updates: Click here to access Travel Vitals™  for the latest information and advisories for
your upcoming itinerary.

Many states and countries have quarantine restrictions, vaccine and documentation requirements.
These requirements may need to be completed several days prior to arrival. Alternatively, ask your
travel consultant to advise of the current requirements. All information related to COVID-19 provided
by Lawyers Travel is based on the information available at the time of reservation and is subject to
change.

For additional information, Please see the DOS website and CDC website. Due to the evolving
nature of COVID-19, we cannot guarantee the accuracy and completeness of any such information
provided.

Lawyers Travel does not represent or warrant that any destination set forth on this itinerary is safe,
advisable to visit or without risk or that any travel restrictions listed are accurate and up to date.
Lawyers Travel assumes no liability for any financial damages or health issues that may result from
travel to such destinations, including, but not limited to, any damages relating to contracting
COVID-19 as a result of reliance on any travel information provided by Lawyers Travel.

Airlines have implemented enhanced security screenings for passengers when departing/arriving at
most airports worldwide. Please ensure you allow extra time to complete the check in process and
to clear security. Many carriers, airports and local municipalities have implemented new regulations
requiring travelers to wear face coverings.

 

Billable/NonBillable: B

https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.aa.com/aa/reservation/flightCheckInViewReservationsAccess.do
https://www.tripadvisor.com/AirlineFees
https://www.tripadvisor.com/AirlineFees
https://travelvitals.amexgbt.com/
https://travelvitals.amexgbt.com/
https://travel.state.gov/content/travel/en/traveladvisories/traveladvisories.html/
https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/travelers/index.html


Travel Assistance Contact Information

For travel assistance 24 hours a day, please call your dedicated number at 917-408-8216. 

~none~

Your access code is 01TI.

Other information and remarks

Have you obtained a new Driver's License with a Real ID? May 3, 2023, is the deadline for
compliance with this new standard.
Download GO Lawyers Travel, our complimentary mobile application, to view and manage
itineraries, receive flight alerts, check-in online and more. Register with your business email address
so this trip will automatically appear in the My Trips section of the app. iPhone or Android

Feedback

We value your input and welcome you to provide your feedback  here.

 

https://itunes.apple.com/us/app/go-lawyers-travel/id1140506669?mt=8
https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=com.manticpoint.android.golawyers&hl=en
http://lawyerssurvey.lawyerstravel.com/survey



























